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TERRY GLE c O P.# E-0001-2024 UPC - 07-8. 0-28- 000- 000- 006. 006 01- 00070472- 6000 E-4
S 28  TOMNSHI P; 2 RANGE; 1. 07
BEG 2276 52' W& 702.63' N SE SEC COR N 139' W365.1' 5 139' E 365.38' TO POB EX E 30'
2022 YR - 854. 97 SALE PRI CE: 5, 000. 00
2023 YR - 676. 03 SURPLUS: 13! 350.00
¥§ - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTALTTAX 1, 53(1)' 88 DI AVOND MO 64840
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 650. 00
HAM LTON HOMER & DEBBI E C.O P. # E-0002- 2024 UPC - 08- 7. 0-35-000- 000- 010. 000 01- 00080539-0000 E-6
ON 35 TOWNSHI P; 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 10. 00
WlOA THAT PART SWLYING'S OF RR R W
2022 YR - 387.76 SALE PRI CE: 40, 000. 00
2023 YR - 338. 25 SURPLUS: 39! 154. 99
y& - SOLD TO JOHN STARK
YR -
ADDRESS: 19231 | VY RD
TOTALTTAX 758' 8(1) CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
845. 01
PARKER, MARY E C. O P. # E-0000- 2024 UPC - 13-4. 0-20- 000- 000- 008. 001 02- 00130311- 2000 E-19
SECTION. 20  TOWNSHI P. 28  RANCE: 30 ACRES; 1. 84
BEG 1420' S NW COR SW E 380" S 230° W 380" N 230' TO POB EX RD RF'W
2022 YR - 401. 39 SALE PRI CE: o oo
2023 YR - 350. 06 SURPLUS:
¥§ - SOLD TO REMOVED FRG\/I SALE
YR -
ADDRESS:
TOTAL TAX 751. 45
CoST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 870. 45
REED, FRANCI S A & DARLINE K C_O P.# E-0003-2024 UPC - 14- 3. 0-05- 000- 000- 018. 000 02-00140199- 0000 E-29
SECT |0N 05 TOANSHI P, 28  RANGE: 31
EI/2 SE SE NWEX BEG 30' N SWCOR TH 164" N & S X 58.5" E & W
2022 YR - 506. 23 SALE PRI CE: 20, 000. 00
2023 YR - 441, 17 URPLUS. 18’ 933. 60
¥§ - SOLD TO RODOLFO I~ RODRI GUEZ
YR -
ADDRESS: 9865 CO LN 274
TOTAL_I_TAX 93(7). 618 CARL JUNCTI ON MO 64834
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL , 066. 40
MURRAY, JOHN E Il & M W PARKER TR _E C. O P. # E-0000-2024 UPC - 15-6. 0-23- 000- 000- 006. 009 02- 00150506- 6000  E- 39
SECTI ON 23  TOWMSH P: 28  RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0. 20
N 1/4 COR SEC 23 E 864.94' TO POB S 375 S 49 DEG E 25 N 390° E TO PCB
2022 YR - 35. 66 SALE PRI CE: 0. 00
2023 YR - 32. 30 SURPLUS: 0. 00
YR - SOLD TO NO BID
YR -
YR -
ADDRESS:
TOTAL TAX 67.96
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 186. 96
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WLKERSO\I BRYAN & TESH A C_O P. # E-0004-2024 UPC - 15-9. 0- 29- 000- 000- 033. 000 02- 00150680- 0000  E- 40
SECTI ON. 29  TOWNSH RANGE: 32 ACRES: 6. 20
BEG SW OOR NW SE. S 90, 4 s 72 DEG E 199.5' N 52 DEG E 897.5' N_31 DEG W427.7' N 84 DEG W 175 W?210.5' S 27 DEG w232' N 85 DEGWT
OWLN SE S POB EX BEG SE COR NE 1/4 SW1/4 S 89 DEG E 50.67 N 4DEGE210 16' N 89 DEG W58.75° S TO POB & EX B
2022 YR - 375. 20 SAL CE. 6, 000. 00
2023 YR - 2, 236. 04 3. 269. 76
¥§ - S(]_D TQ VI NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 1oo CO RD 130
TOTAL TAX 2,611. 24 AVOND MO 64840
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
2,730. 24
CERTI FI CATE J20 C.O P.# E-0005- 2024 UPC - 16-2. 0- 09- 040- 002- 002. 000 02- 00160088- 1000  E-41
SECTION: 09  TOMSH P: 28  RANCGE: 33 ES: 4.21
NE SE S CENTER CREEK & E BRANCH EX E 660
2022 YR - 270. 23 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 233. 86 SURPLUS: 376. 91
¥§ - SOLD TO GARY LEHMVAN
YR -
ADDRESS: 19295 | VY RD
TOTALTTAX 5861. 88 CARTHAGE MD 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 623. 09
MARTI N, THERESA J C. O P. # E-0006-2024 UPC - 16-4.0-17-000- 000- 051. 000 02- 00160221- 0000  E-43
SECTION. 17  TOMSH P: 28 RANGE: 33 ~ ACRES: 1. 00
210" 'S LYI NG 210' 'WOF SE COR SE Sw
2022 YR - 269. 64 SALE PRI CE: 20, 000. 00
2023 YR - 233. 34 SURPLUS: 19’ 378.02
¥§ - SOLD TO CAMDEN ELLi S
YR -
ADDRESS: 6137 JOPLIN ST
TOTAL TAX 502. 98 CARL JUNCTI ON MO 64834
COosT 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 621. 98
TEETER, M TCHELL C.O P.# E-0007-2024 UPC - 16-5. 0- 15- 030- 002- 002. 000 02- 00160374- 0000  E- 44
SECTION:. 15 TOMSH P; 28  RANGE: 33 ~ACRES: 0.93
RE HW NE COR NWSWWL./2 SWN & E HAWY
2022 YR - 18. 67 SALE PRI CE: 155. 14
2023 YR - 17. 47 SURPLUS:
¥§ - SOLD TO W LLI AM DEAN SI TTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 6421 GE
TOTAL TAX 36. 14 JOPLI N MD 64801
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 155. 14
H LTON, MKE & VALORI E C.O P.# E-0008-2024 UPC - 18-1.0-11-000- 000- 009. 005 02- 00180080- 1003  E-50
SECTION. 11  TOANSHI P: 27 RANGE: 34 ~ACRES: 2. 42
N 135 S 540" NI/2 LOT 2 Nw
2022 YR - 478. 05 SALE PRI CE: 4, 000. 00
2023 YR - 408. 21 SURPLUS: 2:994. 74
m - SOLD TO CRANESHA™ JONES
YR -
ADDRESS: 1820 VI RG NI A AVE
TOTAL TAX 886. 26 JOPLI N MD 64804
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 005. 26
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SALAS NOE & DALI LA MARTI NEZ C.OP.# E- 0009 2024 UPC - 14-2.0-04- 010- 028- 004. 000 03-00250113-0000 E-75
SECT 04 TOMSHI P 28 RANGE: 31 ~ACRES 0.23
RORG E 98" LOTS 77 & 78
2022 YR - 3, 680. 06 SALE PRI CE: 10, 000. 00
2023 YR - 1 433. 81 SURPL US: 2. 767,13
ys - SOLD TO ANA K S5ALAS
YR -
ADDRESS: 312 THEO GREY
TOTALTTAX 7, 19198' 88 DUENVEG MO 64841
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
7,232.87
JONES, GARY C.O. P.# E-0010- 2024 UPC - 14-2.0-03-020- 024- 014. 000 03-00250593- 0000 E-81
SECTI ON: 03 TO/\NSHI P: 28 RANGE; 31 ACRES: 0.00
BULG NS SUPPL LOT 61 EX W/2 S 127
2022 YR - 63. 78 SALE PRI CE: 239. 50
2023 YR - 56. 72 SURPLUS:
ys - SOLD TO MARTI NEZ PRODERTI ES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %VARI O MARTI NEZ
TOTAL TAX 120. 50 410 S CASE ST
T 90. 00 CARTHAGE MD 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 239.50
HARBI N, HATTIE A % KAREN MOORE C.O P.# E-0011-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-03-020- 024- 005. 000 03- 00250602- 0000 E-82
CTI ON: 03 H P. 28 RANGE: 31 ~ACRES: 0.00
LG SUPPL S1/2 LOT 68
2022 YR - 54. 79 SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
2023 YR - 48. 92 SURPLUS: 277.29
¥§ - SOLD TO MARTI NEZ PROPERTI ES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %VARI O MARTI NEZ
TOTAL TAX 103. 71 410 S CASE ST
CoST 90. 00 CARTHAGE MD 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 222,71
JONES, GARY C. O P. # E-0012-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-03-030-013-023. 000 03-00251999- 0000 E-93
SECTI ON: 03 TQ/\NSHI P. 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.00
HOLMANS ADD N1/2 LOT 5
2022 YR - 43.55 SALE PRI CE: ,500 00
2023 YR - 39. 15 SURPLUS: 298. 30
¥s - SOLD TO KEl TH MAXWEL L
YR -
ADDRESS: 4744 S DEER RUN LOOP
TOTAL TAX 82. 70 CARTHAGE MD 64836
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 201. 70
SNO- WHI TE_PROPERTI ES C. O P. # E-0013-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-04-010-011-017. 000 03- 00252640- 0000 E-97
SECTI ON. 04 TOMSHI P: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.18
CAR N 40" LOT 242
2022 YR - 449. 69 SALE PRI CE: 25, 000. 00
2023 YR - 400. 37 SURPLUS:  24. 030. 94
m - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTAL TAX 850. 06 DI D MO 64840
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 969. 06
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SI MONDS,  SHI RLEY J_& D HEDGECORTH C.OP.# E- 0014 2024 UPC - 14-2.0-09- 030- 002- 005. 000 03-00253243- 0000 E- 100
SECTION: 09 TOMSHI P: 28 RANGE: 31 ~ACRES 0.31
PARSONS SUB LOT 5
2022 YR - 1, 523. 48 SALE PRI CE: 65, 000. 00
2023 YR - 1. 359.09 SURPLUS: 61,998 43
¥§ - SOLD TO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: 9% M BENDE
TOTAL _TAX 2,882. 57 2401 E 32N ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 OPLI N MO 6480
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 3,001. 57
RECTOR, BETTY D C. O P. # E-0015-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-10-010- 003-012. 000 03- 00253497- 0000  E- 101
SECTION:. 10 TOWNSHI P: 28  RANGE: 31 ~ACRES: 0.17
PROSPECT PARK LOT 107
2022 YR - 678. 99 SALE PRI CE: 60, 000. 00
2023 YR - 580. 68 SURPLUS: 58! 621. 33
¥§ - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTAL_I_TAX 1, 238' 88 DI AVOND MO 64840
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 378. 67
JONES,_ GARY C C.O P.# E-0016- 2024 UPC - 14-2.0-03-020- 024- 020. 000 03- 00253630- 0000 E- 103
SECT 03 H P: 28 . 31 ~ACRES: 7
SCHNUR & COFFEENS LOT 6 E OF LOTS 67 & 68 BULG NS SUPPL ADD
2022 YR - 36. 82 SALE PRI CE: 189 13
2023 YR - 33. 31 SURPLUS:
¥§ - TO “MARTI NEZ PR(PERTI ES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %VARI O MARTI NEZ
TOTAL TAX 70. 13 410 S CASE ST
cos 90. 00 CARTHAGE MD 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 189. 13
NUGENT, JESSI CA C. O P. # E-0000- 2024 UPC - 14-2.0-09-010- 016- 005. 000 03- 00254059- 0000 E- 106
SECTION. 09 TOWNSHI P; 28  RANGE: 31 ~ACRES: 0.17
THACKERS 4TH LOT 32 EX N 4' FOR ST
2022 YR - 751. 67 SALE PRI CE: 0.00
2023 YR - 665. 28 SURPLUS: 0. 00
¥§ - SOLD TO REMOVED FROM SALE
YR -
ADDRESS:
TOTAL TAX 1, 416. 95
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
1,535, 95
SWEENEY, JEFF ETAL C.O P.# E-0017-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-09-020- 010- 002. 000 03-00254297- 0000 E- 108
SECTION. 09  TOWNSHI P; 28 RANGE: 31 ~ACRES: 0. 33
DD LOTS 13 & 14
2022 YR - 726. 20 SALE PRI CE: 3, 000. 00
2023 YR - 643. 13 SURPLUS: 1.511.67
m - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTAL TAX 1,3 DI AMOND MO 64840
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SNO- V\EI TEOEIRODSRTI ES P 28 _c.so P. # E-0018-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-09-010-011- 002. 000 03-00254774-0000 E-115
CAR M'SC BEG AT NW COR LOT 29 E 68" S 135 W47.2' NWTO BEG PART LOT 29
2022 YR - 722. 46 SALE PRI CE: 2, 500. 00
2023 YR - 641. 85 SURPL US: 016. 69
¥§ - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTAL _TAX 1, 364. 31 DI AVOND MO 64840
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 1, 483. 31
OZARK DW DE C.OP.# E-0019-2024 UPC - 14-2.0-03-010- 001- 003. 000 03- 00255256- 0000  E-119
SECTION. 03 TOWNSHI P, 28  RANGE: 31 3.92
R M SC E LN RIVER ST & N R¥WLN RR TH S 85 DEG E 301.81' o OB TH CONT S 85 DEG W 515 + OR - TO CENTER OF O\/ERHEAD POWERLI N
E RUNNLNG N'LY TH N ALG SD PONERLI NE 282" N 82 DEG W550° + OR - S 08 DEG W 162, 03" N 82 DEG W?241.19' TO E LN RIVE
2022 YR - 4,582. 87 SALE PRI CE: 9, 000. 00
2023 YR - 4172, 29 SURPLUS: 125. 84
¥§ - SOLD TO JOSE FRANCI SCO LOPEZ
YR -
ADDRESS: 8415 PERSHI NG RD
TOTAL TAX 8, 755. 16 RAYTONW MO 64138
CoST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 8,874.16
NEL SON, JACQUEL NE_ L C.O. P. # _E-0020-2024 UPC - 23-3.0-08-030-018-005. 000 08-00730288- 0000 E- 130
SECTION.”° 08  TOWNSHI P, 27  RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.00
GARRI SON S ADD LOTS 25 & 26
2022 YR - 125. 40 SALE PRI CE: 3, 500. 00
2023 YR - 110. 28 SURPLUS: 3145 32
ys - SOLD TO MARIE G LLESPI E
YR -
ADDRESS: 1003 CLARENCE S
TOTAL TAX 235. 68 SARCOXI E MO 64862
CoST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 354. 68
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DELI NQUENT TAX SALE -

JASPER COUNTY YEAR OF 2024

MJURRAY, JOHN E Il & M W PARKER TR E
SECTI O\ 23 TOMNSHI P: 28

COM N 1/4 COR SEC 23 E 1289. 94’
' E 50" N 900 0" TOP

S 900 00' W5 OB
2021 YR - 133. 84
2022 YR - 119. 88
2023 YR - 105. 45

YR -

YR -
TOTAL_TAX 359. 17

T 115. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00

AL 503. 17

'C_O P.# E-0000-2024
S 348.54' W16. 77

0.89
S 02 DEG W 25.89" TH CRV/ RGT W RAF 1143’

UPC - 15-6. 0-23-000-000-006. 000
ARC/ LNGTH 27.93" TO POB CONT ALG RD RF'W

SALE PRI CE: 0. 00
SURPLUS: 0. 00
SOLD TG NO BID

ADDRESS:

02-00150506- 0000 E- 144



08/ 26/ 2024 CENTRAL FI RST PUBLI CATI ON

DELI NQUENT TAX SALE -

JASPER COUNTY YEAR OF 2024

ELLI STON I\/ARK A C. O P.# C 0001-2024
SE ACRES: 0.24

CT 02 TOANSHI RANGE: 34
ASBURY HOLLAND' S LOTS 1 TO 3 INC BLK 5
2022 YR - 91. 24
2023 YR - 79.94

YR -

YR -

YR -
TOTAL_TAX 171.18
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 290. 18

LOVELL, BURTON L C_O P.# C0002-2024
S ACRES: 0.21

ECTION: 07 T H P, 28 RANGE: 33
GAULT & SKINNER' S S1/2 LOT 354 & ALL LOT 355
2022 YR - 637. 30
2023 YR - 553. 83
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL_TAX 1,191. 13
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL ,310. 13
THOVAS, LARRY M & CARG_ N_K C.O P.# C0003-2024
SECTION. 10 H P 28 RANGE: 33 ES; 22
Cl E- ORA ACRES 3RD BEG 171.34' E OF NW COR LOT 18 E 190'
G W120° S 79 DEG W 188.05° NE TO POB
2022 YR - 91. 54
2023 YR - 80. 41
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL_TAX 171. 95
COoST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 290. 95

C 14

S 79 DEG W50’

N 11 DE

ANDERSON, CHET_& TRACY C.O P.# C0004-2024
ON: ACRES: 0.00

C 16

SECTI 07 TOMSHI P: 28 RANGE. 33
SVEED S ADD LOT 404 & N 6' LOT 405
2022 YR - 205. 33
2023 YR - 181. 64
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL TAX 386. 97
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 505. 97
KUNTER | NVESTMENTS C.O P.# C 0005- 2024
SECTION: _17 _ TOMNSHI P, 28 = RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.12
CIV L & Z 1ST LOT 39 EX S 12
2022 YR - 52.61
2023 YR - 46. 80
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL TAX 99. 41
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 218. 41

UPC - 06-1.2-02-020-001-001. 000 12- 00950020- 0000
SALE PRI CE 290. 18
SURPL UL 0.
OLD TGO I\/ARTI NEZ PRODERTI ES, LLC
ADDRESS: %VAR|I O MARTI NEZ
410 S CASE ST
CARTHAGE MO 64836
UPC - 16-3.0-07-010-003-007. 000 13- 00940731- 0000
SALE PRI CE: 10, 000. 00
SURPLUS: 8. 689. 87
OLD TO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
ADDRESS: %I M BENDE
2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
LIN MO 6
UPC - 16-2. 0-10-040-002-006. 000 13-00941100- 0000
CURV RGT W 1138.37' RAD 135.28' S 11 DEG E 19.71'
SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
SURPLUS:; 209. 05
OLD TGO BONI LLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC
ADDRESS O/FgAlélgl SC(BD BONI LLA
CARTHAGE MO 64836
UPC - 16-3.0-07-010-009-007. 000 13- 00941410- 0000
SALE PRI CE 1, 500. 00
URPLUS: 994, 03
TO  CRANESHA JONES
ADDRESS: 1820 VIRG NI A AVE
JOPLI N MO 64804
UPC - 15-4.0-17-010-025-013. 000 14-00960172- 0000

SALE PRI CE: 2,500. 00
SURPLUS; 81.59
SOLD TG KERRY

C 19
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FARRELL CONSTRUCT ON | NC C.OP. # C— 0006 2024 UPC - 15-4.0-17-010- 007- 002. 001 14- 00960246- 1000 C- 20
SECTION. 17  TOMSHI P: 28  RANGE: 32 ACR 0.19
CTV L & Z 2ND__LOTS 79 TO 81 INCEXCO\/IN\NOOQLOT 79 S 89 DEGE?O 03' TO POB S 89 DEG E 70.03' TONECORLOT 79 S 100 N 89 DEG W7
0, 05' 100° TO POB EX ALL TH PRT LOTS 79 & 80 BEG NW COR LOT 79 S 89 DEG E 7o 03' S 100" N 89 DEG W 70.03'
2022 YR - 74.82 SAL CE 500. 00
2023 YR - 65. 97 SURPL 240, 21
¥§ - SOLD TO V\ALD LAND DEVEL OPMENT
YR -
ADDRESS: 9%JUST| N WALD
TOTAL _TAX 140. 79 4749 N PEACE CHURCH AVE
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MD 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 259.79
LUKE, DAVID & KATHY C.O P.# C-0007-2024 UPC - 15-4.0-17-010- 008- 003. 000 14- 00960252- 0000 C-21
SECTION: 17  TOWNSHI P: 28 ~ RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
L & Z 2ND LOTS 94  TO 97 INC
2022 YR - 269. 96 SALE PRI CE: 6 000. 00
2023 YR - 222.81 SURPL US: 388. 23
y& - SOLD TO Vi NCEN’T PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTAL TAX 492. 77 DI AVOND MO 64840
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 611. 77
HOYT, Tl MOTHY C.O P.# C-0008-2024 UPC - 15-4.0-17-010- 026- 009. 000 14-00960814- 1000 C- 26
SECTI ON' 17 TOWMSH P. 28  RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.32
S S COS6TH LOTS 12 & 21
2022 YR - 315. 96 SALE PRI CE: 1, 500. 00
2023 YR - 244. 04 SURPLUS: 821. 00
¥s - SOLD TO PROPI EDADES ABUNDANTES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %].GA MAZARI EGOS
TOTAL TAX 560. 00 P O BOX 581
CoST 90. 00 VEBB CI TY MO 64870
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 679. 00
M LLER, SHIRLEY T TR O P. # C 0009-2024 UPC - 20-2.0-10-010- 004- 006. 000 15-00123033-0000 C- 31
SECTION: 10 ONNSHI P: 27  RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.01
DUEN ORIG E 6' LOT 22 BLK 4
2022 YR - 347. 19 SALE PRI CE: 2, 000. 00
2023 YR - 17.72 SURPLUS: 1.516. 09
¥§ - SOLD TO LAND DEVELOPMENT
YR -
ADDRESS: 9%JUST| N_WALD
TOTAL TAX 364. 91 4749 N PEACE CHURCH AVE
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MD 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 483. 91
EPPERSON. BILLIE D & THELMA R C. O P.# C 0010- 2024 UPC - 20-4.0-17-020- 003- 005. 000 16-00125191- 0000 C-41
SECTION. 17 T H P, 27 RANGE: 32 ~ACRES: 0.61
LANE 2ND LOT 11
2022 YR - 1, 522. 46 SALE PRI CE: 65, 000. 00
2023 YR - 1, 325. 34 SURPLUS: 62 033 20
m - SOLD TO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %1 M BENDER
TOTAL TAX 2,847.80 2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 OPLIN MO 6
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 2, 966. 80
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BAKER SCOTT C.OP. # c- 0011 2024 UPC - 05-4.2-19-020- 001- 004. 000 18- 00129008- 0000 C-44
SECTION. 19  TOMSHI P: 30 RANGE: 33 0.59
EAST OPCLI S REPLAT LOT 8
2022 YR - 64. 12 SALE PRI CE: 1, 500. 00
2023 YR - 56. 56 SURPL US: 1’ 260,32
¥§ - TO CRANESHA JONES
YR -
ADDRESS: 1820 VI RA NI A AVE
TOTAL _TAX 120. 68 JOPLI N MO 64804
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
239. 68
W LLI AVB, ROBERT D & DORA A C_OP.# C 0012-2024 UPC - 20-5. 0- 16- 020- 008- 003. 000 18- 00149003- 0000 C-45
SECTI ON. 16  TOWNSHI P: RANGE: 32 .71
FREEMAN S 3RD SUB- DI V N1/2 LOT 31 & E1/2 NL/2 LOT 32
2022 YR - 763. 09 SALE PRI CE: 45, 000. 00
2023 YR - 640. 11 SURPLUS: 43! 477.80
y& - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTALTTAX 1, 488' 38 DI AVOND MO 64840
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1,522.20
FRY, KENNETH B & BARBARA A C_OP.# C 0013-2024 UPC - 08-9. 0-31-030-013-001. 000 22-00215140- 0000 C-58
SECTION: 31  TOMSHI P, 29  RANCE: ACRES: 16
ORONOGO GRANBY M & S CO S~ LOTS 29 TO 31 I NC EX M NERAL RI'GHTS
2022 YR - 54. 43 SALE PRI CE: 2, 500. 00
2023 YR - 48.58 SURPLUS: 2. 277.99
ys - SOLD TO CRANESHA JONES
YR -
ADDRESS: 1820 VI RA NI A AVE
TOTAL TAX 103. 01 JOPLI N MD 64804
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 222.01
DAGGETT CHARLES W & MARTHA C_OP.# C 0014-2024 UPC - 08-9.0-31-020- 003- 032. 005 22-00215333-1000 G 59
SECTI ON : TOMSHI P: 29 _RANGE; 32
G 125' 'N & 175" WOF SE COR NWN 25' E 25" N 50' E 30' S 75° W55 TO POB
2022 YR - 18. 87 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 17.71 SURPLUS: 844 42
¥§ - SOLD TO JOHNATHAN WESTGATE
YR -
ADDRESS: 3905 BLACK WALNUT RD
TOTAL TAX 36. 58 SARCOXI E MD 64862
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 155. 58
CAREY, BRADLEY C.O P.# C 0015-2024 UPC - 08-3.2-08-040- 001-017. 000 23-00225242-0000 C 66
SECTI ON: 08 H P: 29 RANGE:. 32 ACRES: 54
PURCELL M SC_ BEG 155' W& 60" N _SE COR N\NSE N 61 DEG W 415 S 60 DEG E 100' S 50' W86.51' N 75 W155' S 200' W 110' S 225 S 64
DEG E TO PT S BEG N TO POB & EX BEG 14' E OF SE COR LOT 29 BALDW NS 2NDE134 82 S 57 DEGE17 72" "N 59.45' S 57 DEG
2022 YR - 103. 63 SALE PRI CE: 9,7000. 00
2023 YR - 82. 27 SURPLUS 8 695 10
m - SOLD TO DARRYL' SW SHER
YR -
ADDRESS: 320 UNI ON
TOTAL TAX 185. 90 JASPER MD 64755
+ COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 304. 90
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GOCDW N, ROBERT G C.OP. # C— 0016 2024 UPC - 16-6. 0-13-040-003-002. 000 25-00980842- 0000 C 74
SECTI ON: 13 TOMSHI P: 28 RANGE: 33 0.16
COTTAGE H LL ADD LOT 19
2022 YR - 134. 54 SALE PRI CE: 5, 000. 00
2023 YR - 109. 34 SURPLUS: 4,637.12
¥E - SOLD TG LAND SCQUT, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK
TOTAL_TAX 243. 88 2212 DINGE DR
T 90. 00 LI N MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 362. 88
GOCDW N, ROBERT G C O P.# C0017-2024 UPC - 16-6. 0-13-040-003-003. 000 25-00980843- 0000 C 75
SECTI ON: 13 TOMSH P; 28 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0. 00
COITAGE H LL ADD LOT 20
2022 YR - 380. 24 SALE PRI CE: 10, 000. 00
2023 YR - 338. 02 SURPLUS: 9,162. 74
¥§ - SOLD TG L SCAUT, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK
TOTAL_TAX 718. 26 2212 DINGE DR
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
837. 26
REDBUD HOVES & CONSTRUCTI ON C. O P.# C0018-2024 UPC - 16-6.0-13-010-023-007. 000 25-00980978- 0000 C 77
SECTI ON: 13 TOWNSHI P 28 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0.16
CROW & NELSONS ADD LOT 56
2022 YR - 523.70 SALE PRI CE: 15, 000.00
2023 YR - 463. 83 SURPLUS: 13, 893. 47
¥s - SOLD TGO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %I M BENDE
TOTAL_TAX 987. 53 2401 32ND ST #10- 339
COoST 90. 00 CPLIN MO
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 1, 106. 53
MULLINS, LOYD C.OP.# C0019-2024 UPC - 15-4.0-19-030-018-038. 000 25-00982492- 0000 C- 83
SECTI O\ TOMSH P: 28 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
SOQUTHHAVEN SUB LOT 13
2022 YR - 1,116.60 SALE PRI CE: 25, 000.00
2023 YR - 974. 05 SURPLUS: 22, 790. 35
¥s - SOLD TG JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %I M BENDE
TOTAL_TAX 2,090. 65 2401 E 32 D ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 2,209. 65
COX, EDNA COSETTA C.OP. # C0020-2024 UPC - 15-4.0-18-010-043-007. 000 25-00982774- 0000 C- 90
SECTI ON; 18 TOMSH P: 28 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0. 00
WEBB'S 3RD LOT 143
2022 YR - 62.11 SALE PRI CE: 1, 500. 00
2023 YR - 52.90 SURPLUS; 1, 265. 99
¥E - SOLD TG GECRGE R STANLEY
YR -
ADDRESS: 1101 E 24TH
TOTALTTAX 1 JOPLI N MO 64804
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V\EBBSEéTI\/‘ b\\(j T§9& B_?BBY ﬁl EI LLY _c.so P.# C-0021-2024 o8 UPC - 15-4.0-19-010- 014- 001. 020 25-00983035-1100 C 93
\SN% MTEEREE]@RT M2 COM 168 E SWCOR SE NE N 674.3" E 270" TO POB N 340' E 317.13' SWALG ST TO PT E OF BEG W 166.15' TO POB EX S 18
2022 - 477.92 SALE PRI CE: ooo 00
2023 YR - 416. 17 SURPLUS: 986. 91

¥§ - SOLD TO MAXI M Lu AN W LI LES
YR -
ADDRESS: 6502 N MAIN ST RD
TOTALTTAX 8861. 88 VEBB CI TY MO 64870
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 013.09
OLIVE L ESTATE C.O P. # C 0022-2024 UPC - 16-7.0-26-030-013-002. 000 26-00205032- 0000 C 94
ECTI T H P, 28 RANGE: 33 ~ACRES: 0.55
N JOPLIN LOTS 83 TO 86 INC
2022 YR - 153. 48 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 134. 68 LUS: 592 84
¥§ - SOLD TO JOHNATHAN WESTGATE
YR -
ADDRESS: 3905 BLACK WALNUT RD
TOTALTTAX 288' 68 SARCOXI E MO 64862
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 407. 16
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AMER| OAN H STORY HOLDI NGS I'NC C._O P.# C0000-2024 UPC - 08-5.0-15-020-011-006. 000 11-00910081- 0000 C- 96
CTI ON. 15 TOMSHI P: 29 RANGE; 32 ACRES:
ST ALBA" LOTS 70 TO 75 ITNC & SI/2 VAC ST ADJ & BEG SE COR LOT 75 N 330.5' E 263.6' S 330.5' WPOB

2021 YR - 9, 208. 61 SALE PRI CE 0. 00
2022 YR - , 950. 01 0. 00
2023 ¥E - 2,648. 58 S(]_D TO NO BI D

YR -

ADDRESS:

TOTAL_TAX 20, 407. 20

T 115. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00

20, 551. 20
JONES, BEN L ESTATE C O P. # C0023-2024 UPC - 20-2.0-03-000-000-001. 700 15-00123404- 0000 C 97

SECTION. 03 T | P; 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0. 00
DUEN M SC* "M NERAL RI GHTS UNDERLYI'NG TRACT LOCATED SE 1/ 4 SEC DESC AS COM 40 RODS N OF SE COR TH N 72 RODS W80 RODS S 32 RODS E 32
RODS S 40 RODS E TO BEG
2021 YR - 19. 22 SALE PRI CE: 198. 51
2022 YR - 18.18 SURP 0.
2023 ¥§ - 17.11 SOLD TO  JOHNATHAN V\ESTGATE

YR -

ADDRESS: 3905 BLACK WALNUT RD

TOTC& TAX 1 SARCOXI E MO 64862
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HEOTLS, J G C. O P.# C0024-2024 UPC - 07-7.0-36-040-001-001. 701 22-00215382- 0000 C-98
SECTION: 36 TOANSHI P: - 29 -3 ; 0. 00
ORONOCGO M SC M N RIGHTS ON NE SE EX 6A GM & S CO S 2ND ADD
2020 YR - 20. 84 SALE PRI CE: 226 42
2022 YR - 18. 87 RPLUS:
2023 ¥E - 17.71 S(]_D TO JO—|NATHAN V\ESTGATE
YR -
ADDRESS: 3905 BLACK WAL NUT
TOTAL_TAX 57.42 SARCOXI E MO 64862
CasT 140. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 226. 42
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TAYLOQ AUTU C OP.# W 0001 2024 UPC - 19-1.0-02-020-018-004. 000 31-00000058-0000 W2
SECTI ON; TOMSHI P: 27 RANGE; ACRES: 0.16
JOPLIN (]QI G LOT 6 & E1/2 VAC ALLEY ADJ BLK 8
2022 YR - 69. 79 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 61. 93 SURPLUS: 749. 28
¥E - SOLD TG MARTI NEZ PROPERTIES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %VAR|I O MARTI NEZ
TOTAL_TAX 131.72 410 S CASE ST
T 90. 00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 250. 72
COUNTY 202 C. O P.# W0002-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-030-038-009. 000 31-00000461-0000 W6
p. 27 RANGE; 33~ _ACRES; 0. 00

SECTI O\l 10 TOJ\NS?

BARBEE PARK ADD E E 78" LOT 46 EX ST RR'W

2022 YR - 704. 60 SALE PRI CE: 1, 449. 14
2023 YR - 625. 54 SURPLUS! 0.
¥§ - SOLD TG MAPLE LEAF REALTY HOLDI NGS, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %W LLI AM W LLI AVS
TOTAL_TAX 1,330. 14 718 E CAPI TOL AVE
T 90. 00 JEFFERSON CI TY MO 65101
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 1,449. 14
ELLIS, TIM C. O P.# WO0003-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-019-012. 000 31-00000959-0000 W9
SECTI ON; _10 TONNSHI P: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
B WREALTY COS LOT 9
2022 YR - 175. 22 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 156. 44 SURPLUS: 549. 34
YR - DTO L SCaUT, LLC
R
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK
TOTAL_TAX 331. 66 2212 DI NGLE DR
CasT 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 450. 66
720 PI CHER C._O P.# W0004-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-005-009. 003 31-00001016- 3000 W12
SECT | O\l 10 TOMNNSHI P, 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0.00
ERS & MURPHYS 2ND LOT 20
2022 YR - 41. 57 SALE PRI CE: ,000 00
2023 YR - 37.43 SURPLUS; 802. 00
¥E - SOLD TGO SO_O\/d\I I NVESTCRS, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: YANDREW SO OVON
TOTAL_TAX 79. 00 306 FOREST
CosT 90. 00 WEBB CI TY MO 64870
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 198. 00
SWFT, STEPHEN M CHAEL & W LLAM NA C. O P.# WO0005-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-015-007. 000 31-00001085- 0000 W 14
L 10 H 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00

- 443. 2 SALE PRI CE: 3, 000. 00
- 394.4 SURPLUS: 2. 043. 25
¥E - SOLD TO. MAPLE LEAF REALTY HOLDINGS, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %W\ LLI AM W LLI AMVS
TOTAL _TAX 837.75 718 CAPI TOL AVE
T 90. 00 JEFFERSON CI TY MO 65101
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 956. 75



08/ 26/ 2024 WESTERN FI RST PUBLI CATI ON

STOUT LEANARD G & LORETTA

SECT 11 TOMNNSHI P: 27 RANGE: 33
CAI\/PBELL S 5TH LOT 64
2022 YR - 615. 24
2023 YR - 80. 62
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL_TAX 695. 86
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 814. 86
YATES _TRACKSI DE FURNI TURE | NC C. O P.# W0007-2024
SECTI ON: 11 TOMSHI P: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0. 00
CAMPBELL'S 6TH N 123" LOT 161
2022 YR - 89. 26
2023 YR - 78.85
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL_TAX 168. 11
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 287.11
HUGHES, _J CO3 C.O P.# WO0008-2024
SECTI ON: TOMSH P; 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.
CAMPBELL' S 9TH S 50' LOT 67
2022 YR - 75. 83
2023 YR - 67. 20
YR -
YR -
YR -
TOTAL_TAX 143. 03
COoST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 262. 03
CARRI LLO BRUNO H C,

OP.
CTION; 36  TOANSHI P; 28  RANGE; 33  ACRES
CASTLE ROCK SUB LOTS 187 & 188 & 1) 2

2022 YR - 303. 55
2023 YR - 268. 48

YR -

YR -

YR -
TOTAL_TAX 572.03

T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00

AL 691. 03
MORI TZ, TYLER C.OP. # WO0010-2024
SE CTI O\l 31 TOMSH P: 28 RANGE; 32 S:
GE SKYLINE ADD N 44" S 60" LOT 6

2022 YR - 106. 71
2023 YR - 94. 01

YR -

YR -

YR -
TOTAL _TAX 200. 72

T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00

AL 319.72

DELI NQUENT TAX SALE - JASPER COUNTY YEAR OF 2024

COP# W0006 2024
ACRES 0. 00

UPC - 19-1.0-11-030-032-004. 000 31-00001881- 0000

SALE PRI CE: 814 86
SURPLUS: 00
OLD TO BONILLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC

ADDRESS: %-RANCI SCO BONI LLA
P O BOX 28
CARTHAGE MO 64836

UPC - 19-1.0-11-040-012-001. 000 31-00002107- 0000

SALE PRI CE: 287.11
SURP : 0. 00
SOLD TG LAND SCQUT, LLC
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK

2 E DR

UPC - 19-1.0-11-030-033-007. 000 31-00002353- 0000

SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
SURPLUS:; 237. 97
OLD TGO BONI LLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC

ADDRESS: %:5AEI8 SCO BONI LLA
CARTHAGE MO 64836

UPC - 16-7.0-36-030-006-015. 001 31-00002758- 0000

SALE PRI CE: 15, 000. 00
SURPLUS: 14, 308. 97
TO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
ADDRESS: %I M BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
JOPLIN MO 64

UPC - 15-9.0-31-040-001-015. 000 31-00003137-1000

SALE PRI CE 319.72
SURPLU! .00
OLD TO PROPI EDADES ABUNDANTES, LLC

ADDRESS: (I):/’GCGQ MAZARI EGOS
VBB CITY MO 64870



08/ 26/ 2024 WESTERN FI RST PUBLI CATI ON DELI NQUENT TAX SALE - JASPER COUNTY YEAR OF 2024 PAGE NO 3

JENNI NCB DARNEL L COP# W 0011 2024 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-007-013. 000 31-00003647- 0000 W 30
11 TOJ\NSHI p: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES 0. 00
CO\IKLI N S1ST LOT 74
2022 YR - 450. 66 SALE PRI CE: 7, 000. 00
2023 YR - 400. 90 US: 6, 029. 44
¥E - S(]_D TO FI XNl X, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %-4ANNAH KI TCH
TOTAL_TAX 851. 56 2109 S MOFFET AVE
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64804
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 970. 56
SHERRI CK, COLLEEN C. O P # W0012-2024 UPC - 19-1.0-02-020-011-009. 000 31-00003789- 0000 W 33
SECTI ON. 02 TOMSHI P: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.11
COX'S 2ND LOT 2 BLK 3
2022 YR - 53.00 SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
2023 YR - 47. 35 SURPLUS; 280. 65
¥§ - SOLD TG JOPLI N AREA HABI TAT FOR HUVANI TY
YR -
ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
TOTAL_TAX 100. 35 5201 N MAIN ST
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 219. 35
MAUS, JEFF C O P # W0013-2024 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-033-008. 000 31-00004222- 0000 W 37
SECTION: 11 TOJ\NSH pP. 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0. 00
JR 4 LOT 121
2022 YR - 57.00 SALE PRI CE: 1, 500. 00
2023 YR - 50. 84 SURPLUS; 1,273.16
¥E - TO J N AREA HABI TAT FOR HUVANI TY
YR -
ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
TOTAL_TAX 107. 84 5201 N MAI'N ST
COoST 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 226. 84
H LL,_ _DALE A C.OP.# W0014-2024 UPC - 19-5. 0-15-020-006-008. 000 31-00004428- 0000 W 39
SECT I O\l 15 TOJ\NSHI pP. 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
T WCUNNINGHAM S LOT 195
2022 YR - 441. 25 SALE PRI CE: 5, 000. 00
2023 YR - 391. 58 SURPLUS: 4,048. 17
¥E - SOLD TG JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %I M BENDER
TOTAL_TAX 832. 83 2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 951. 83
STRATTON, HERBERT L C. O P.# WO0015-2024 UPC - 19-6.0-14-010-013-019. 000 33-00006906- 0000 W53
SECTI ON:™ 14 TOMSHI P; 27 RANGE: 33 Al
IHA_IR@EOI:-IEI GHTS E 90.12" S 24" LOr 138 & E 10° N 35' LOT 139 & N 35 LOT 140 & S 24' LOT 138 EX E 90.12' THERECOF & EX S 11' OF W70
2022 YR - 760. 35 SALE PRI CE: 65, 000. 00
2023 YR - 676. 30 SURPLUS: 63 444 35
¥E - SOLD TO. JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: /6I'I M BEN
TOTAL _TAX 1,436. 65 2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 555. 65
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TATE, KRI STY & MONTE C.OP.# W0016 2024 UPC - 19-5. 0- 15- 040- 032- 003. 000 33-00007908- 0000 W62
SECTION. 15  TOWNSHI P; 27 RANGE: 33 ~ACRES 0. 00
LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 120
2022 YR - 548. 06 SALE PRI CE 45, 000. 00
2023 YR - 487. 28 43! 845 66
¥§ - S(]_D TO JOSE FRANCI SCO LOPEZ
YR -
ADDRESS: 8415 PERSHI NG RD
TOTAL TAX 1, 035. 34 YT 64138
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1, 154. 34
J PEARL PROPERTI ES C.O P.# W0017-2024 UPC - 19-5. 0- 15- 040- 012- 004. 000 33-00008045- 0000 W65
SECTION. 15 _ TOMSHI P; 27  RANGE: 33~ ACRES: 0.18
LUKES SOUTHERN S 20' LOT 286 & ALL LOT 287 EX S 10
2022 YR - 104. 04 SALE PRI CE: 314. 73
2023 YR - 91. 69 SURP
¥§ - SOLD TO THI MBLE & IRO\I LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: YBRENDA WELLS
TOTAL TAX 195. 73 306 E PINTAIL DR
T 90. 00 QZARK MO 65721
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 314. 73
J PEARL PRODERTI ES C. O P. # W 0018- 2024 UPC - 19-5. 0-15- 040- 012- 006. 000 33-00008047- 0000 W67
SECTION. 15 _ TOMSHI P; 27 RANGE: 33 ~ACRES: 0.15
LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 289
2022 YR - 88. 61 SALE PRI CE: 285. 88
2023 YR - 78. 27 SURPLUS: 0. 00
¥§ - SOLD TO THIMBLE & i RON, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: O/BRENDA VEELLS
TOTAL TAX 166. 88 306 _E PINTAIL DR
COosT 90. 00 K MO 65721
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 285. 88
J PEARL PROPERTI ES C.O P.# W0019- 2024 UPC - 19-5. 0- 15- 040- 012- 007. 000 33-00008048- 0000 W 68
SECTION. 15 _ TOMSH P, 27 RANGE: 33 ~ACRES: 0. 00
LUKES SOUTHERN LOTS 290 & 291
2022 YR - 88. 61 SALE PRI CE 500. 00
2023 YR - 78. 27 214 12
¥§ - so_D TO THI MBLE & i RON, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: 9BRENDA VELLS
TOTAL TAX 166. 88 06 E PINTALL DR
T 90. 00 QZARK MO 65721
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 285. 88
J PEARL PROPERTI ES O P.# W0020- 2024 UPC - 19-5. 0- 15- 040- 014- 006. 000 33-00008121- 0000 W71
SECTION. 15 _ TOWMSH P, 27  RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.15
LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 371
2022 YR - 87.90 SALE PRI CE: 284. 56
2023 YR - 77.66 SURPLUS: 0. 00
m - SOLD TO GEORGE R STANLEY
YR -
ADDRESS: 1101 E 24TH
TOTAL TAX 165. 56 JOPLI N MD 64804
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 284. 56
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J PEARL PRO:’ERTI ES COP# W0021 2024 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-014-004. 000 33-00008123- 0000 W73
SECTI ON._ 15 TOMNNSHI P, 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES 0.15
LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 373
2022 YR - 87.90 SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
2023 YR - 77.66 SURPLUS: 215. 44
¥E - OLD TO BONI LLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %-RANCI SCO BONI LLA
TOTAL_TAX 165. 56 P O BOX 28
T 90. 00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 284. 56
KENNEDY, RUTH C O P. # W0022-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-050-015. 000 33-00008747-0000 W78
SECTI ON: 10 TOMSH P: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.15
M TCHELLS 1ST LOT 173
2022 YR - 440. 58 SALE PRI CE: 2, 000. 00
2023 YR - 84. 68 SURPLUS: 1,355.74
¥§ - SOLD TG LAND SCQUT, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK
TOTAL_TAX 525. 26 2212 DINGE DR
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
644. 26
J PEARL_PROPERTI ES C O P # W0023-2024 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-014-011. 000 33-00009017- 0000 W81
SECTI ON: 15 TOMSH P: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES; .21
o SKA SUB THAT PART LOT 4 COM ON PILE AVE AT PT 175" NE OF SWCOR SD LOT SE & PARALLEL TO LN DIV LOTS 4 & 5 IN SD ADD TO E LN LOT
2022 YR - 123. 50 SALE PRI CE: 500. 00
2023 YR - 108. 60 SURPLUS:; 148. 90
¥E - SOLD TG BON LLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %:RANCI SCO BONI LLA
TOTAL_TAX 232.10 P O BOX
COoST 90. 00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 351.10
LAND GO PROPERTI ES C.OP.# W0024-2024 UPC - 19-6. 0-14-030-052-008. 000 33-00010241- 0000 W91
SECTI ON._ 14 TOMSH P; 27 RANGE: 33 : 0.41
OULKE LOTS 423 TO 425 INC & LOT 426 EX N 47
2022 YR - 7,188. 60 SALE PRICE: 13, 703. 43
2023 YR - 6, 395. 83 SURPLUS; 0. 00
YR - SOLD TGO Fi XNI X, LLC
R e
ADDRESS: %-HANNAH KI TCH
TOTAL_TAX 13,584.43 2109 S I\/[]:FET AVE
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64804
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 13, 703. 43
WHALEY, ROSALIE O P.# W0025-2024 UPC - 19-1.0-01-040-003-011. 000 33-00010862- 0000 W 96
SECTI ON: 01 TOMSHI P. 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 1.38

K GROVE 'LOTS 17 TO 19 INC

2022 YR - 495. 66 SALE PRI CE: 4,500. 00
2023 YR - 431. 83 SURPLUS; 3, 453. 51
¥E - SOLD TO. ELI ZABETH O DELL
YR -
ADDRESS: 233 S OZARK AVE
TOTALTTAX 9 JOPLIN MO 64801
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EMERY, CAROLYN S & ROGER W EMERY ET C.OP.# wooze 2024 UPC - 16-7.0-36-010-001- 107. 000 33-00012281-0000 W 114
SECTI ON_ 36 Hi 33 ACRES 0. 00
ROVAL HEI GUTS  LOTS 201 TO 203 | NG
2022 YR - 615. 24 SALE PRI CE: 15, 000. 00
2023 YR - 543. 86 SURPLUS: 13! 721.90
¥§ - SOLD TO Vi NCENT PATTON
YR -
ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
TOTALTTAX 1, 188' (1)8 DI AMOND MO 64840
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1,278.10
J PEARL PRGDERTI ES C.O P. # W 0027-2024 UPC - 19-5. 0- 15- 040- 014- 003. 000 33-00150353- 1000 W 117
SECTI ON._ 15 _ TOWNSHI 27 _RANGE: 33 ~ACRES: 0.24
LUKES SOUTHERN LOTS 374 & 375
2022 YR - 133. 60 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 117. 37 Sul : 630. 03
¥§ - SOLD TO ALEYDA BENAVI DES
YR -
ADDRESS: 10731 HAMVER RD
TOTAL TAX 250. 97 NEOSHO MO 64850
T 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 369. 97
TANDY, DANNY E JR & ALEXANDRA M STE C. O P. # W 0028-2024 UPC - 19-5. 0-15- 010- 016- 003. 000 35-00012869- 0000 W 118
SECTI TOMNSHI P 27 . 33 ACRES: 0.14
SCHI FFERDECKERS 1ST  LOT 104
2022 YR - 1, 337. 35 SALE PRI CE: 4,500. 00
2023 YR - 1, 184. 47 SURPLUS: 1,859 18
¥§ - SOLD TO THIMBLE & i RON, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: YBRENDA WELLS
TOTAL TAX 2,521. 82 306 _E PINTAIL DR
COosT 90. 00 K MO 65721
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 2, 640. 82
DODD, JI MY EDWARD C.O P.# W0029- 2024 UPC - 19-3.0-05-011-001-012. 000 35-00013133-0000 W 119
SECTION. 05 TOWSHI P; 27  RANGE: 33 0.00
SGHl FFERDEGKER PARK © 51/ 2 LOT 12 & ALL LOT 13 BLK 1
2022 YR - 48. 95 SALE PRI CE: 1, 000. 00
2023 YR - 43. 83 SURPLUS: 788. 22
¥§ - SOLD TO Ei LEEN M JOHNSON
YR -
ADDRESS: 4254 N PEACE CHURCH AVE
TOTAL TAX 92.78 JOPLIN MO 64801
COST 90. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 211.78
NS, CASEY O P.# W0030- 2024 UPC - 19-2.0-09-020-006-013. 001 35-00013571- 0000 W 128
SECTION.~ 09 OMSHI P, 27  RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
£l NT & COS LOT 258
2022 YR - 420. 43 SALE PRI CE: 30, 000. 00
2023 YR - 374. 09 SURPLUS: 29! 086. 48
m - SOLD TO JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: 91 M BENDER
TOTAL TAX 794.52 2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 OPLIN MO 6
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 913. 52
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Bl ESEMEI ER. BRIAN T COP# W 0031 2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-030-010. 000 35-00013754-0000 W 130
SECTION. 10 TOMNSHI P, 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES 0. 00
O JOP L CO 1ST LOT 69
2022 YR - 583. 67 SALE PRI CE: 40, 000.00
2023 YR - 498. 91 SURPLUS: @ 38, 798. 42
¥E - SOLD TO FIXNI'X, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %-4ANNAH KI TCH
TOTAL_TAX 1,082.58 2109 S MOFFETT AVE
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64804
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 1,201.58
PATTERSON PARKER, DELI SA ETAL C. O P.# W0032-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-049-010. 000 35-00013924-0000 W 135
SECTI 10 H P: 27 RANGE: 33 _ACRES: 0.10
JOP L CO2ND S 21' E 26' LOT 61 & E 35" LOT 62
2022 YR - 95. 32 SALE PRI CE: 298. 44
2023 YR - 84.12 SURPLUS; 0. 00
¥§ - OLD TGO BONI LLA ENTERPRI SES, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %-RANCI SCO BONI LLA
TOTAL_TAX 179. 44 P O BOX 28
+ COST 90. 00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 298. 44
RILEY, PAUL A & DOREEN M C. O P.# WO0033-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-061-012. 000 35-00013937-0000 W 136
SECTI O\l 10 TOMSH P, 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0.14
SO JOP L CO 2ND LOT 72
2022 YR - 415. 06 SALE PRI CE: 2,500. 00
2023 YR - 81.76 SURPLUS: 1,884.18
¥s - SOLD TG LAND SCQUT, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %CADEN PENNI CK
TOTAL_TAX 496. 82 2212 DI NGLE DR
+ T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
T 615. 82
ESTES, MADI SON C.OP.# WO0034-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-10-030-008-002. 000 35-00014209- 0000 W 139
SECT | ON; 10 TOJ\NSHI p: 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0.00
O JOP L CO 4TH LOT 2
2022 YR - 609. 18 SALE PRI CE: 45, 000. 00
2023 YR - 503. 58 SURPLUS: 43, 768. 24
¥s - SOLD TG JASPER COUNTY 2024, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %I M BENDER
TOTAL TAX 1,112.76 2401 E 32ND ST #10- 339
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64
+ REC. FEE 29.00
1,231.76
JENKINS, TERESA A & D VI LLANI _ETAL C.O P.# WO0035-2024 UPC - 19-6. 0-14- 030- 006- 002. 000 35-00014885-0000 W 143
SECTION. 14  TOMSHIP. 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0. 00
THOWPSON S ADD LOT 72
2022 YR - 136. 29 SALE PRI CE: 2,500. 00
2023 YR - 119. 69 SURPLUS; 2,125.02
¥s - OLD TO. TRAVI S LEDFORD CONSTRUCTI ON, LLC
YR -
ADDRESS: %IRAVI S LEDFORD
TOTAL _TAX 255. 98 2808 W26TH ST
T 90. 00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
AL 374. 98
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WOOLVEN, PAUL L C.O P.# WO0000-2024 UPC - 19-2.0-03-010-024-005. 000 35-00015816-0000 W 149
CTI ON. 03 TOMNSHI P; 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES: 0.02
LSON & HUTTON 2ND LOT 184 EX S 50

SALE PRI CE:
SURPLUS:
SOLD TG NO BID

oo
oo

ADDRESS:
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JOPLIN BUSI NESS & | NDUST DEV_CORP C O P.# W 0000-2024 UPC - 15-9. 0-30-000-000-036.018 33-00007300-2201 W161

SECTI ON; 30 T H P. 28 RANGE; 32 ACRES: 73
JOPLIN I ND PARK BEG 40' S & 939.43' E NWCOR LOT 2 E 117.43' SWALG RR 269.5' NW275.78 TO POB
2021 YR - 675.72 SALE PRI CE 0. 00
2022 YR - 600. 10 0. 00
2023 ¥E - 522. 30 S(]_D TO NO BI D

YR -

ADDRESS:

TOTAL_TAX 1,798.12

T 115. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL ,942. 12

I NDUSTRI AL DEV AUTH OF JOPLIN C O P.# W 0000-2024 UPC - 15-9. 0-30-000-000-036. 006 33-00007300-2400 W 162

SECTI ON: 30 TOMSH P: 28 RANGE; 32 ACRI
JOPLIN 1 ND PARK  BEG | NT WR' WLN RR SPUR & N LN LOT 3 NW277.98 E 150' SWTO INT SPUR RFW& MAIN LINE R WNW TO PCB
2021 YR - 741. 25 SALE PRI CE: 0.00
2022 YR - 658. 08 SURPLUS: 0. 00
2023 ¥§ - 572.57 SOLD TG NO BID

YR -

ADDRESS:

TOTAL_I_TAX 1, %
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W LLES, NORMAN E COP# W 0000 2024 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-028-001. 000 31-00004232-0000 W 163
SECTION: 11 TOMNSHI P, 27 RANGE: 33  ACRES 0.10
C COX JR LOT 133 EX S 20°
2020 YR - 432. 26 SALE PRI CE 0 00
2021 YR - 50. 87
2022 YR - 46. 27 S(]_D TO JASPER CGJNTY TRUSTEE
2023 YR - 41.52
YR -
ADDRESS:
TOTAL_TAX 570. 92
T 140. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
AL 739. 92
JOPLIN SQJTHER CORP C_O P.# WO0000-2024 UPC - 20-4.0-18-000-000-051. 001 35-00014320-1000 W 164
ECTION:. 1 H P: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.
JOP SOUTHERN CORP 1ST N 25' LOT 6 BLK 4 & BEG NW COR LOT 6 BLK 4 W430.68 S 25' E 430.68" N TO POB
2020 YR - 239. 40 SALE PRI CE: 0 00
2021 YR - 211.54 SURPLUS: 00
2022 YR - 188. 64 SOLD TG JASPER CQJNTY TRUSTEE
2023 ¥B - 165. 08
ADDRESS:
TOTAL_TAX 804. 66
T 140. 00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 973. 66
JOPLIN SOQUTHERN CORP C. O P. # W0036-2024 UPC - 20-4.0-18-000-000-079. 000 35-00016576- 1000 W 165
SECTI ON. 18 TOMSH P 27 RANGE: 32 ES; 0.67
JOP_ M SC__BEG NE_ COR BLK 5 JOP SOUTHERN CORP_1ST E 759.16' S 0.28' SLY 438.90" ALG CURV RT WRAD 394.41' S 64 DEG W42.49' S 65 NG6
4 DEG E 73.21' NE_ALG CURV LT W454.41' RAD 506. 52’ TO POB
2020 YR - , 029. 15 SALE PRI CE: 3, 605. 32
2021 YR - 905. 18 S X 0.
2022 YR - 803. 33 SOLD TG ALEYDA BENAVI DES
2023 ¥E - 698. 66
ADDRESS: 10731 HAMMVER R
TOTAL_TAX 3,436. 32 NECSHO MO 64850
T 140. 00
+ REC. FEE 29. 00
TOTAL 3, 605. 32



