

PROVIN, CLIFFORD A C.O.P.# E-0001-2022 UPC - 07-7.0-25-000-000-011.003 01-00070428-3000 E-4
 SECTION: 25 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.78
 BEG 600' S NE COR E 1/2 SE S 200' W 200' N 200' E 200' TO POB EX RD

2020 YR - 1,694.56
 2021 YR - 1,715.08
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 60,000.00
 SURPLUS: 56,466.36
 SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON

TOTAL TAX 3,409.64
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 3,533.64

ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 DIAMOND MO 64840

HUGHES TR & BENWARD TR C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 08-4.0-18-000-000-005.005 01-00080297-5200 E-11
 SECTION: 18 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
 BEG NW COR SEC S 40' NELY ALG RD R/W 130' W TO POB

2020 YR - 18.03
 2021 YR - 16.83
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 34.86
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 158.86

ADDRESS:

LEE, RANDALL S & CAROL H C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 08-6.0-24-000-000-009.003 01-00080504-3000 E-14
 SECTION: 24 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 5.95
 E1/2 SW SE EX S 497' OF E 353' & EX BEG 353' W SE COR SW SE TH W 299.66' N 331'E 303.54' S TO POB EX RD

2020 YR - 43.56
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 43.56
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 167.56

ADDRESS:

SMITH, TONY R & LISA J C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 08-9.0-32-000-001-004.012 01-00080757-3300 E-16
 SECTION: 32 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 1.33
 E 60' OF N 1006.43' OF W 10 AC NE NE EX RD

2020 YR - 17.99
 2021 YR - 17.18
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 35.17
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 159.17

ADDRESS:

FRANKLIN, DANIEL C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 09-8.0-33-010-010-003.000 01-00090558-1000 E-24
 SECTION: 33 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.46
 BEG 1872.3' S & 90' W NE COR S 257' W 78.55' N 260' E 78.45' TO POB

2020 YR - 231.15
 2021 YR - 300.00
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 531.15
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 655.15

ADDRESS:

RECEIVED
 AUG 24 2022
 TREASURER

KENNEDY, MICHAEL P & PATRICIA M C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 09-8.0-34-000-000-024.000 01-00090608-0000 E-26
SECTION: 34 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.34
BEG 2138.6' S NW COR SEC E 53.8' N 271.4' TO CENTER RD TH W 60.6' S 271.4' E 6.8' TO POB EX RD (BEING PT SE NE SEC 33 & PT SW NW SE C 34)
2020 YR - 63.13 SALE PRICE: 0.00
2021 YR - 54.25 SURPLUS: 0.00
YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
YR - ADDRESS:
YR -
TOTAL TAX 117.38
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 241.38

RALSTON, TRAVIS L & KERI D C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 10-9.0-32-000-000-001.001 01-00100471-1000 E-28
SECTION: 32 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 30 ACRES: 1.74
BEG 301.18' S NE COR SE NE W 1023.98' TH ALG CUV LT W/50' RAD 249.81' TH E 760' S 300' E 270' N TO POB EX COM NE COR SEC 32 S 1685.8
9' TO POB S 301.18' N 89 DEG W 266' N 301.18' S 89 DEG E 266' TO POB EX RD R/W
2020 YR - 240.26 SALE PRICE: 0.00
2021 YR - 201.60 SURPLUS: 0.00
YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
YR - ADDRESS:
YR -
TOTAL TAX 441.86
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 565.86

KUNTER INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 11-8.0-34-000-000-003.001 01-00110277-0000 E-32
SECTION: 34 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.68
E 33' E1/2 W1/2 NE NE EX N 417.4'
2020 YR - 17.77 SALE PRICE: 0.00
2021 YR - 16.46 SURPLUS: 0.00
YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
YR - ADDRESS:
YR -
TOTAL TAX 34.23
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 158.23

CUNNINGHAM, AYMEE N C.O.P.# E-0002-2022 UPC - 14-5.0-15-010-018-024.000 02-00140689-0000 E-51
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 1.17
BEG 325.16' W SE COR SW NE TH W 430.2' N 295.16' E 430.5' S 295.16' TO BEG EX W 230' & EX N 40' THEREOF
2020 YR - 1,050.99 SALE PRICE: 35,000.00
2021 YR - 965.57 SURPLUS: 32,859.44
YR - SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC
YR - ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
YR - 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
TOTAL TAX 2,016.56 JOPLIN MO 64804
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,140.56

WHITTINGTON, TIFFANY C.O.P.# E-0003-2022 UPC - 14-6.0-14-000-000-002.002 02-00140752-1000 E-52
SECTION: 14 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.84
BEG 478.03' S & 70.65' W NE COR SECF W 324.93; N 04 DEG E 95.96' N 43 DEG E 141.54; S 48 DEG E ALG S RR R/W 294.84' TO POB
2020 YR - 551.83 SALE PRICE: 1,877.43
2021 YR - 201.60 SURPLUS: 1,000.00
YR - SOLD TO: MICHAEL CUTBIRTH
YR - ADDRESS: 2110 E FAIRVIEW
YR - CARTHAGE MO 64836
TOTAL TAX 753.43
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 877.43

RUSSOW, NANCY C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 14-9.0-30-000-000-001.004 02-00141020-4000 E-53
 SECTION: 30 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.65
 N 295' W 176' E1/2 NE EX RD EX BEG 27.43' E & 37.62' S NW COR E1/2 E 80.64' S 103.67' W 80.64' N TO POB

2020 YR -	257.76	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2021 YR -	224.30	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 482.06
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 606.06

ADDRESS:

TAYLOR, VICTORY JR & INA C.O.P.# E-0004-2022 UPC - 16-8.0-28-010-001-004.000 02-00160592-0000 E-59
 SECTION: 28 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 1.22
 BEG 531' W NE COR TH W 256' S 252' E 210' NELY 256.4' TO BEG

2020 YR -	431.72	SALE PRICE:	945.89
2021 YR -	390.17	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	VINCENT PATTON
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 821.89
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 945.89

ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 DIAMOND MO 64840

FISH, LEO J & EVALEE G TR C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 20-2.0-09-000-000-043.010 02-00200190-4100 E-83
 SECTION: 09 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.58
 BEG 380' S NW COR SW SW E 150' S 83 DEG E 182.08' E 302.04' S 40' W 302.04' N 83 DEG W 182.08' W 150' N 40' TO POB

2020 YR -	96.65	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2021 YR -	87.72	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 184.37
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 308.37

ADDRESS:

KUNTER INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 20-3.0-08-020-002-071.000 02-00200285-0000 E-84
 SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.90
 N 60' M/L W 653.5' SE NW

2020 YR -	96.96	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2021 YR -	87.98	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 184.94
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 308.94

ADDRESS:

VASQUEZ, OVIED & MARIA C C.O.P.# E-0005-2022 UPC - 14-2.0-09-010-018-020.000 03-00254023-0000 E-116
 SECTION: 09 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.17
 THACKERS 3RD LOT 29

2020 YR -	425.84	SALE PRICE:	15,000.00
2021 YR -	382.05	SURPLUS:	14,068.11
YR -		SOLD TO:	COUNTY 2022, LLC
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 807.89
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 931.89

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
 JOPLIN MO 64804

GUZMAN, NOE C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 14-2.0-04-030-027-043.000 03-00254641-0000 E-119
SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.10
CAR MISC LOT 99

2020 YR -	55.43	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2021 YR -	47.75	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -		ADDRESS:	

TOTAL TAX	103.18		
+ COST	95.00		
+ REC. FEE	29.00		
TOTAL	227.18		

U S BANK NATIONAL ASSOCIATION C.O.P.# E-0006-2022 UPC - 11-9.0-31-010-002-011.000 04-00270034-0000 E-122
SECTION: 31 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.00
AV ORIG LOTS 1 & 2 & E1/2 LOT 3 BLK 8

2020 YR -	53.48	SALE PRICE:	223.49
2021 YR -	46.01	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	JAMES WILLIAMSON
YR -			
YR -		ADDRESS:	P O BOX 52
YR -			AVILLA MO 64833

TOTAL TAX	99.49		
+ COST	95.00		
+ REC. FEE	29.00		
TOTAL	223.49		

COLEMAN, JOYCE SUE C.O.P.# E-0007-2022 UPC - 03-6.0-23-010-001-009.000 05-00490135-0000 E-125
SECTION: 23 TOWNSHIP: 30 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.00
JAS ORIG LOT 1 EX S 39' BLK 25

2020 YR -	17.59	SALE PRICE:	158.95
2021 YR -	17.36	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	ANTHONY TAYLOR
YR -			
YR -		ADDRESS:	315 N MAIN ST
YR -			JASPER MO 64755

TOTAL TAX	34.95		
+ COST	95.00		
+ REC. FEE	29.00		
TOTAL	158.95		

OUTT, RICHARD LEE C.O.P.# E-0008-2022 UPC - 13-7.0-26-040-004-015.000 07-00690102-0000 E-134
SECTION: 26 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 30 ACRES: 1.93
REEDS MISC BEG 40' W & 30' S SW COR LOT 392 WHITAKER ADD W 200' S 420' E 200' N TO POB

2020 YR -	171.91	SALE PRICE:	2,141.14
2021 YR -	145.23	SURPLUS:	1,700.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	KENNETH SPURGEON
YR -			
YR -		ADDRESS:	6184 E 3RD
YR -			REEDS MO 64859

TOTAL TAX	317.14		
+ COST	95.00		
+ REC. FEE	29.00		
TOTAL	441.14		

LUPER, SHANE M C.O.P.# E-0009-2022 UPC - 23-3.0-08-040-001-012.001 08-00730569-1000 E-137
SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.29
SAR MISC S 140' OF W 90' OF MISC LOT 35

2020 YR -	411.73	SALE PRICE:	906.62
2021 YR -	370.89	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	VINCENT PATTON
YR -			
YR -		ADDRESS:	100 CO RD 130
YR -			DIAMOND MO 64840

TOTAL TAX	782.62		
+ COST	95.00		
+ REC. FEE	29.00		
TOTAL	906.62		

REIDHEAD, SHERI L C.O.P.# E-0000-2022 UPC - 23-3.0-08-030-021-011.000 08-00730645-0000 E-138
SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.19
SAR MISC COM SE COR SE 1/4 SW 1/4 N 88 DEG W 766.76' N 30' TO N R/W JOPLIN ST TO POB N 88 DEG W 44.27' N 150.04' S 88 DEG E 44.27'
N 150.04' S 88 DEG E 47.67' S 150' TO POB
2020 YR - 56.10 SALE PRICE: 0.00
2021 YR - 199.46 SURPLUS: 0.00
YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
YR -
YR -
TOTAL TAX 255.56 ADDRESS:
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 379.56

CRUM, KATHY E C.O.P.# E-0010-2022 UPC - 14-5.0-16-020-009-003.000 09-00790029-0000 E-144
SECTION: 16 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.44
SOUTH SIDE ADD LOTS 69 & 70
2020 YR - 313.78 SALE PRICE: 3,103.26
2021 YR - 165.48 SURPLUS: 2,500.00
YR - SOLD TO: DARRELL COLE
YR -
YR - ADDRESS: 9190 CO LN 172
TOTAL TAX 479.26 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 603.26

MARTIN, THOMAS N & ETHEL C.O.P.# E-0011-2022 UPC - 14-5.0-16-020-010-006.000 09-00790051-0000 E-145
SECTION: 16 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.00
SOUTH SIDE ADD LOTS 119 & 120
2020 YR - 90.44 SALE PRICE: 591.42
2021 YR - 76.98 SURPLUS: 300.00
YR - SOLD TO: ALEX LANE CONSTRUCTION, LLC
YR -
YR - ADDRESS: %ALEX LANE
TOTAL TAX 167.42 19275 MILLWOOD RD
+ COST 95.00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 291.42

MARTIN, THOMAS N & ETHEL C.O.P.# E-0012-2022 UPC - 14-5.0-16-020-018-006.000 09-00790053-0000 E-146
SECTION: 16 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.00
SOUTH SIDE ADD LOTS 125 TO 128 INC
2020 YR - 184.96 SALE PRICE: 475.62
2021 YR - 166.66 SURPLUS: 0.00
YR - SOLD TO: RUSSELL CHORN
YR -
YR - ADDRESS: 1038 W LIBERTY ST
TOTAL TAX 351.62 CARTHAGE MO 64836
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 475.62

MCKINNEY, ROGER A & MARJORIE L C.O.P.# E-0000-2022
 SECTION: 26 TOWNSHIP: 30 RANGE: 29 ACRES: 0.01
 BEG 98' W & 79.5' N SE COR TH N 6' W 6' S 6' E TO BEG

UPC - 01-7.0-26-040-001-003.000 01-00010071-0000 E-147

2019 YR - 18.22
 2020 YR - 17.25
 2021 YR - 15.66
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 51.13
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 200.13

ADDRESS:

MCCONNELL, DIANNA J C.O.P.# E-0013-2022
 SECTION: 03 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 31 ACRES: 0.00
 WALE'S ADD E1/2 LOT 2 EX N 51' & E1/2 LOT 3

UPC - 14-2.0-03-030-024-003.000 03-00254163-0000 E-149

2019 YR - 54.55
 2020 YR - 49.24
 2021 YR - 42.62
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 595.41
 SURPLUS: 300.00
 SOLD TO: ALEX LANE CONSTRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 146.41
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 295.41

ADDRESS: %ALEX LANE
 19275 MILLWOOD RD
 CARTHAGE MO 64836

GRAY, JOHN L & SHANNON M C.O.P.# C-0001-2022
SECTION: 16 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
ALBA-R F COLLIN'S LOTS 3 & 6

UPC - 08-5.0-16-040-002-006.000 11-00910058-0000 C-5

2020 YR - 132.74
2021 YR - 113.88
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,070.62
SURPLUS: 700.00
SOLD TO: ALEX LANE CONSTRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 246.62
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 370.62

ADDRESS: %ALEX LANE
19275 MILLWOOD RD
CARTHAGE MO 64836

HUGHES LIVING TR & BENWARD LIVING T C.O.P.# C-0002-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
ALBA MISC COM AT NW COR LOT 66 E ALBA N 126' E 71' S 126' W TO BEG

UPC - 08-5.0-15-020-011-004.000 11-00910272-0000 C-11

2020 YR - 119.39
2021 YR - 102.59
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,045.98
SURPLUS: 700.00
SOLD TO: EDNA COSETTA COX

TOTAL TAX 221.98
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 345.98

ADDRESS: 21029 NETTLE LANE
JASPER MO 64755

CHAMBELL, MICHAEL J C.O.P.# C-0000-2022
SECTION: 05 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.17
CHITWOOD'S 2ND LOT 49

UPC - 16-3.0-05-030-026-003.000 13-00940364-0000 C-13

2020 YR - 90.34
2021 YR - 78.43
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 168.77
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 292.77

ADDRESS:

HANCE, DON C.O.P.# C-0000-2022
SECTION: 06 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.35
SKINNER'S 1ST LOTS 184 & 185 & N 3' LOT 186

UPC - 16-3.0-06-040-032-001.000 13-00941329-1000 C-20

2020 YR - 781.26
2021 YR - 668.83
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 1,450.09
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 1,574.09

ADDRESS:

ESLICK, SARA A C.O.P.# C-0003-2022
SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 2.00
C J MISC BEG 285' N SE COR SW W 337.43' NW ALG ROAD 251.78' E 367.98' S 250' TO POB

UPC - 16-3.0-08-030-003-049.001 13-00941705-1000 C-24

2020 YR - 1,130.33
2021 YR - 1,150.03
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 20,000.00
SURPLUS: 17,595.64
SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

TOTAL TAX 2,280.36
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,404.36

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
JOPLIN MO 64804

KUNTER INVESTMENTS

SECTION: 17 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 C.O.P.# C-0004-2022 ACRES: 0.12
CTV L & Z 1ST LOT 39 EX S 12'

UPC - 15-4.0-17-010-025-013.000 14-00960172-0000 C-29

2020 YR - 48.36
2021 YR - 42.56
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 214.92
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: RUSSELL REED

TOTAL TAX 90.92
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 214.92

ADDRESS: 1811 VIRGINIA
JOPLIN MO 64801

HAMEL, DEBORAH L

SECTION: 17 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 C.O.P.# C-0005-2022 ACRES: 0.11
S C M & S CO'S 5TH LOT 426

UPC - 15-4.0-17-010-034-001.000 14-00960765-0000 C-35

2020 YR - 57.65
2021 YR - 50.43
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 232.08
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: WILLIAM ENDICOTT

TOTAL TAX 108.08
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 232.08

ADDRESS: 18525 CO RD 260
ORONO GO MO 64855

ROTH, SHIRLEY J

SECTION: 17 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 C.O.P.# C-0006-2022 ACRES: 0.00
S C M & S CO'S 6TH LOT 77

UPC - 15-4.0-17-010-023-006.001 14-00960868-0000 C-36

2020 YR - 46.95
2021 YR - 41.35
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 212.30
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: DERRICK REYNOLDS

TOTAL TAX 88.30
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 212.30

ADDRESS: 306 N FOUNTAIN ST
CARTERVILLE MO 64835

CAMPBELL, MRS A B

SECTION: 21 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 C.O.P.# C-0007-2022 ACRES: 14.47
CTV MISC UND 1/10 UND 1/2 W 3/4 SW NW S & W OF RR R/W

UPC - 15-5.0-21-000-000-040.002 14-00961097-0000 C-38

2020 YR - 18.46
2021 YR - 17.19
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 3,559.65
SURPLUS: 3,400.00
SOLD TO: TODD MCCORCLE

TOTAL TAX 35.65
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 159.65

ADDRESS: 2725 E 12TH
JOPLIN MO 64801

CAMPBELL, MRS A B

SECTION: 21 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 C.O.P.# C-0008-2022 ACRES: 11.56
CTV MISC UND 1/10 UND 1/2 W 3/4 SW NW N & E OF RR R/W EX RD

UPC - 15-5.0-21-000-000-039.002 14-00961097-1000 C-39

2020 YR - 18.46
2021 YR - 17.19
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 2,000.00
SURPLUS: 1,840.35
SOLD TO: TODD MCCORCLE

TOTAL TAX 35.65
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 159.65

ADDRESS: 2725 E 12TH
JOPLIN MO 64801

PETTIT, JERRY L SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 C.O.P.# C-0009-2022 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.17 DUEN ORIG LOTS 1 & 2 BLK 5

UPC - 20-2.0-10-010-007-002.000 15-00123035-0000 C-40

2020 YR - 100.26
2021 YR - 93.28
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 317.54
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: MFH, LLC

TOTAL TAX 193.54
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 317.54

ADDRESS: %MICHAEL FORREST
1194 CRANE DR
JOPLIN MO 64804

JACKSON, DAVID W SECTION: 07 TOWNSHIP: 27 C.O.P.# C-0010-2022 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.25 DUQ MISC BEG NE COR LOT 7 LYING 65.97' W & 466.09' S NE COR NW SW S 208' W 52' N 208' E TO BEG

UPC - 20-3.0-07-030-004-012.000 16-00125453-0000 C-47

2020 YR - 74.20
2021 YR - 67.54
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 265.74
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

TOTAL TAX 141.74
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 265.74

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
JOPLIN MO 64804

WALD, DAVID L SECTION: 28 TOWNSHIP: 28 C.O.P.# C-0011-2022 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 1.05 LONE ELM ACRES N 225' LOTS 53 & 54 & W 30' S 175' LOT 54

UPC - 16-8.0-28-000-000-042.004 18-00185031-2000 C-59

2020 YR - 170.98
2021 YR - 145.98
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 440.96
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: SKYMAR ENTERPRISES, LLC

TOTAL TAX 316.96
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 440.96

ADDRESS: %SKYLER ROSS
5957 E 20TH ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

COKER, CAROLE SECTION: 31 TOWNSHIP: 29 C.O.P.# C-0012-2022 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.29 NORTH TOWN VILLAGE PHASE III LOT 114

UPC - 08-9.0-31-040-010-004.000 22-00215274-3560 C-63

2020 YR - 1,723.37
2021 YR - 1,689.72
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 71,000.00
SURPLUS: 67,462.91
SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON

TOTAL TAX 3,413.09
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 3,537.09

ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
DIAMOND MO 64840

HUMPHREY, CANDICE M SECTION: 31 TOWNSHIP: 29 C.O.P.# C-0013-2022 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 1.01 ORONO GO MISC BEG 400' N & 200' W SE COR NE NW W 1104.17' S 200' W 20' N 390' E 1100' S 100' E 25' S 100' TO POB EX COM SE COR NE 1/4 NW 1/4 N 400' N 88 DEG W 25' TO W R/W GRANT ST & POB N 88 DEG W 1286.33' N 200' S 88 DEG E 651.96' S 100' S 88 DEG E

UPC - 08-9.0-31-020-001-037.000 22-00215306-0000 C-64

2020 YR - 80.63
2021 YR - 73.66
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 278.29
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: TRAVIS SHAFER

TOTAL TAX 154.29
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 278.29

ADDRESS: 210 BAKER ST
ORONO GO MO 64855

HOOVER, VICKIE S C.O.P.# C-0014-2022 UPC - 08-9.0-31-030-024-019.000 22-00215339-0000 C-67
SECTION: 31 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 2.17
ORONOGO MISC BEG 175' N SW COR SE SW TH N 350' E 270' S 350' W TO POB

2020 YR -	250.87	SALE PRICE:	9,000.00
2021 YR -	237.03	SURPLUS:	8,388.10
YR -		SOLD TO:	CHRISTOPHER TOWNSEND
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 487.90 ADDRESS: 5875 W EMERALD RD
+ COST 95.00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 611.90

HEOTIS, J G C.O.P.# C-0000-2022 UPC - 07-7.0-36-040-001-001.701 22-00215382-0000 C-70
SECTION: 36 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
ORONOGO MISC MIN RIGHTS ON NE SE EX 6A G M & S CO'S 2ND ADD

2020 YR -	18.56	SALE PRICE:	0.00
YR -		SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 18.56 ADDRESS:
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 142.56

TIBBENS, W R JR C.O.P.# C-0000-2022 UPC - 15-4.0-18-010-013-008.000 25-00980792-0000 C-82
SECTION: 18 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.23
COOK & HATTENS 1ST LOTS 15 & 16

2020 YR -	115.04	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2021 YR -	99.90	SURPLUS:	0.00
YR -		SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 214.94 ADDRESS:
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 338.94

ELLIS, MARY C & MARVIN E C.O.P.# C-0015-2022 UPC - 15-3.0-07-010-008-009.031 25-00982407-5350 C-92
SECTION: 07 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.23
ROBIN RIDGE 3RD SUB LOT 7 EX S 4'

2020 YR -	1,171.96	SALE PRICE:	65,000.00
2021 YR -	1,081.59	SURPLUS:	62,622.45
YR -		SOLD TO:	COUNTY 2022, LLC
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 2,253.55 ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
+ COST 95.00 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
+ REC. FEE 29.00 JOPLIN MO 64804
TOTAL 2,377.55

RUSSELL, C R & MARGARET C C.O.P.# C-0016-2022 UPC - 20-3.0-05-000-000-041.000 26-00247023-0000 C-104
SECTION: 05 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.85
TRAVIS ACRES N1/2 LOT 31 EX W 1.5A

2020 YR -	448.74	SALE PRICE:	15,000.00
2021 YR -	419.98	SURPLUS:	14,007.28
YR -		SOLD TO:	VINCENT PATTON
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 868.72 ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
+ COST 95.00 DIAMOND MO 64840
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 992.72

GRONWOLD, ROGER & AILEEN C.O.P.# C-0017-2022 UPC - 20-3.0-08-020-002-045.000 18-00131009-0000 C-112
SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.01
EAST PARK PLACE W 5.05' LOT 7

2019 YR -	33.22	SALE PRICE:	240.97
2020 YR -	30.44	SURPLUS:	0.00
2021 YR -	28.31	SOLD TO:	BRIAN F SPENCER
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 91.97 ADDRESS: 4920 W 7TH ST
+ COST 120.00 JOPLIN MO 64801
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 240.97

NUGENT, JASON A C.O.P.# C-0000-2022 UPC - 08-3.2-08-040-010-004.000 23-00225182-1000 C-115
SECTION: 08 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.00
PURCELL ORIG LOT 636

2019 YR -	76.73	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2020 YR -	68.68	SURPLUS:	0.00
2021 YR -	59.85	SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 205.26 ADDRESS:
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 354.26

SMITH, KELLY & KELLY TORIX C.O.P.# C-0000-2022 UPC - 06-6.0-14-010-013-003.000 24-00269027-0000 C-116
SECTION: 14 TOWNSHIP: 29 RANGE: 34 ACRES: 0.00
WACO ORIG LOTS 62 & 63

2019 YR -	46.61	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2020 YR -	43.91	SURPLUS:	0.00
2021 YR -	38.86	SOLD TO:	NO BID
YR -			
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 129.38 ADDRESS:
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 278.38

BELK, DAVID & PATRICIA BELK C.O.P.# C-0018-2022 UPC - 15-4.0-18-030-012-007.001 25-00980262-1000 C-117
SECTION: 18 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.03
BYERS & BALLS ADD E 16' OF W 54' S 14' LOT 151 & E 16' OF W 54' LOT 152

2018 YR - 30.72
2019 YR - 30.93
2020 YR - 28.43
2021 YR - 25.69
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,689.77
SURPLUS: 1,400.00
SOLD TO: GOSSETT PROPERTIES, LLC

TOTAL TAX 115.77
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 289.77

ADDRESS: %RICK GOSSETT
21704 OLD RITCHEY RD
GRANBY MO 64844

TAYLOR, AUTUMN C.O.P.# W-0001-2022
 SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.16
 JOPLIN ORIG LOT 6 & E1/2 VAC ALLEY ADJ BLK 8

UPC - 19-1.0-02-020-018-004.000 31-00000058-0000 W-2

2020 YR - 92.53
 2021 YR - 82.24
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 298.77
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: ALEX LANE CONSRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 174.77
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 298.77

ADDRESS: %ALEX LANE
 19275 MILLWOOD RD
 CARTHAGE MO 64836

720 PICHER TR C.O.P.# W-0002-2022
 SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 BYERS & MURPHYS 2ND LOT 20

UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-005-009.003 31-00001016-3000 W-13

2020 YR - 198.93
 2021 YR - 37.18
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 2,160.11
 SURPLUS: 1,800.00
 SOLD TO: TODD MCCORCLE

TOTAL TAX 236.11
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 360.11

ADDRESS: 2725 E 12TH
 JOPLIN MO 64801

ANDREWS, DELORIS & ROY RAY C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
 SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.08
 BYERS & MURPHYS 3RD W 70' LOT 103

UPC - 19-2.0-10-010-029-002.000 31-00001225-0000 W-15

2020 YR - 341.48
 2021 YR - 313.36
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 654.84
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 778.84

ADDRESS:

DOBEMAR INVESTMENTS INC C.O.P.# W-0003-2022
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 CAMPBELL'S 5TH LOT 5

UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-036-009.000 31-00001829-0000 W-17

2020 YR - 57.72
 2021 YR - 50.46
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,532.18
 SURPLUS: 1,300.00
 SOLD TO: TODD MCCORCLE

TOTAL TAX 108.18
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 232.18

ADDRESS: 2725 E 12TH
 JOPLIN MO 64801

SUNNYVALE INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
 CAMPBELL'S 9TH LOT 14

UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-037-005.000 31-00002313-0000 W-22

2020 YR - 219.38
 2021 YR - 50.46
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 269.84
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 393.84

ADDRESS:

WESTFAL, SCOTT C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-040-001.000 31-00002316-0000 W-23
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 CAMPBELL'S 9TH LOTS 17 & 18

2020 YR - 98.62 SALE PRICE: 0.00
 2021 YR - 85.13 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
 YR -
 YR -

TOTAL TAX 183.75 ADDRESS:
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 307.75

BOWLES, JAMES T C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-030-033-001.002 31-00002331-3000 W-24
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 CAMPBELL'S 9TH LOT 43

2020 YR - 337.39 SALE PRICE: 0.00
 2021 YR - 297.78 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
 YR -
 YR -

TOTAL TAX 635.17 ADDRESS:
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 759.17

SHOAL CREEK LEASING INC C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-2.0-10-010-042-002.000 31-00002367-0000 W-25
 SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.52
 CARTERS 1ST LOTS 9 TO 12 INC & S 1/2 VAC 11TH ST ON N SIDE THEREOF

2020 YR - 2,353.33 SALE PRICE: 0.00
 2021 YR - 823.94 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
 YR -
 YR -

TOTAL TAX 3,177.27 ADDRESS:
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 3,301.27

SUNNYVALE INVESTMENT PROPERTIES C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-2.0-10-010-031-002.000 31-00002457-0000 W-26
 SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.07
 CARTERS 1ST LOT 141 EX RR R/W

2020 YR - 178.45 SALE PRICE: 0.00
 2021 YR - 22.15 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: NO BID
 YR -
 YR -

TOTAL TAX 200.60 ADDRESS:
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 324.60

EBENER, EDNA C.O.P.# W-0004-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-033-009.000 31-00004223-0000 W-40
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.11
 J C COX JR 4TH S 40' LOT 122

2020 YR - 391.28 SALE PRICE: 558.23
 2021 YR - 42.95 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: ALEX LANE CONSTRUCTION, LLC
 YR -
 YR -

TOTAL TAX 434.23 ADDRESS: %ALEX LANE
 + COST 95.00 19275 MILLWOOD RD
 + REC. FEE 29.00 CARTHAGE MO 64836
 TOTAL 558.23

WILLES, NORMAN E C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.10
J C COX JR 4TH LOT 133 EX S 20'

UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-028-001.000 31-00004232-0000 W-41

2020 YR - 342.86
2021 YR - 41.21
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 384.07
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 508.07

ADDRESS:

HARPER, THOMAS & DARLENE C.O.P.# W-0005-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
T W CUNNINGHAM'S LOT 17

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-022-002.000 31-00004278-0000 W-42

2020 YR - 1,046.08
2021 YR - 968.57
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 3,638.65
SURPLUS: 1,500.00
SOLD TO: RONALD MILLARD

TOTAL TAX 2,014.65
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,138.65

ADDRESS: 1378 CO RD 52
SARCOXIE MO 64862

BLENDVILLE DEVELOPMENT CO C.O.P.# W-0006-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
T W CUNNINGHAM'S LOT 136

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-043-003.000 31-00004380-0000 W-44

2020 YR - 92.53
2021 YR - 79.93
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,096.46
SURPLUS: 800.00
SOLD TO: WILD LENDERS, LLC

TOTAL TAX 172.46
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 296.46

ADDRESS: %HOLLAND B MUKASA
P O BOX 1352
HOLLISTER MO 65673

K & J INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# W-0007-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
T W CUNNINGHAM'S LOT 252

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-028-010.000 31-00004463-0000 W-45

2020 YR - 106.84
2021 YR - 93.22
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 324.06
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JOPLIN AREA HABITAT FOR HUMANITY

TOTAL TAX 200.06
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 324.06

ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
5201 N MAIN ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

SHIVLEY, BRIAN & JONI C.O.P.# W-0008-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
T W CUNNINGHAM'S LOT 289

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-007-008.001 31-00004497-1000 W-46

2020 YR - 93.85
2021 YR - 81.09
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 498.94
SURPLUS: 200.00
SOLD TO: JOPLIN AREA HABITAT FOR HUMANITY

TOTAL TAX 174.94
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 298.94

ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
5201 N MAIN ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

HAYES, MICHAEL E JR C.O.P.# W-0009-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-01-030-040-014.000 31-00004949-0000 W-50
SECTION: 01 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
EAST HIGHLAND LOT 153

2020 YR - 432.21
2021 YR - 394.83
YR -
YR -
YR -

TOTAL TAX 827.04
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 951.04

SALE PRICE: 20,000.00
SURPLUS: 19,048.96
SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
JOPLIN MO 64804

ROBINSON, ADOLPHUS ETAL C.O.P.# W-0010-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-02-010-033-007.000 31-00004977-0000 W-51
SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.10
EAST JOPLIN LOTS 2 & 3 BLK 1

2020 YR - 50.22
2021 YR - 44.10
YR -
YR -
YR -

TOTAL TAX 94.32
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 218.32

SALE PRICE: 1,018.32
SURPLUS: 800.00
SOLD TO: JOPLIN AREA HABITAT FOR HUMANITY

ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
5201 N MAIN ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

BULLETTE, LOUIS & C STEERE ETAL C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-2.0-09-030-003-006.000 33-00006254-0000 W-59
SECTION: 09 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
GARDEN PARK ADD LOTS 37 & 38

2020 YR - 356.50
2021 YR - 320.30
YR -
YR -
YR -

TOTAL TAX 676.80
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 800.80

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

KITCHEN, DONNA M C.O.P.# W-0011-2022 UPC - 19-6.0-13-030-013-011.000 33-00007296-7000 W-67
SECTION: 13 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
JAMESTOWN VILLAGE 2ND LOTS 42 & 43 EX BEG SW COR LOT 43 N 79' N 68 DEG E 123.87' TO W LN 28TH ST CH DIST S 56 DEG E 54.78' TO NE CO
R LOT 43 S 90.26' W 160.97' TO POB

2020 YR - 1,247.98
2021 YR - 1,140.76
YR -
YR -
YR -

TOTAL TAX 2,388.74
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,512.74

SALE PRICE: 35,000.00
SURPLUS: 32,487.26
SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
JOPLIN MO 64804

KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0012-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-010-008.000 33-00008062-0000 W-71
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 306

2020 YR - 89.78
2021 YR - 77.63
YR -
YR -
YR -

TOTAL TAX 167.41
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 291.41

SALE PRICE: 3,091.41
SURPLUS: 2,800.00
SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
JOPLIN MO 64804

 KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0013-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-015-019.000 33-00008109-0000 W-72
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 LUKES SOUTHERN LOT 358
 2020 YR - 411.75 SALE PRICE: 4,000.00
 2021 YR - 373.44 SURPLUS: 3,090.81
 YR - SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON
 YR - ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 YR - DIAMOND MO 64840
 TOTAL TAX 785.19
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 909.19

 FEDERAL NATIONAL MORTGAGE ASSOC C.O.P.# W-0014-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-030-045-005.000 33-00008908-0000 W-79
 SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MITCHELLS 2ND LOT 175
 2020 YR - 883.06 SALE PRICE: 1,007.06
 YR - SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON
 YR - ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 YR - DIAMOND MO 64840
 TOTAL TAX 883.06
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,007.06

 WOLF, SHENIA C.O.P.# W-0015-2022 UPC - 19-2.0-03-040-029-008.000 33-00008988-0000 W-80
 SECTION: 03 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.07
 MOFFET'S SUB E1/2 LOT 73
 2020 YR - 505.87 SALE PRICE: 1,093.46
 2021 YR - 463.59 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC
 YR - ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
 YR - 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
 YR - JOPLIN MO 64804
 TOTAL TAX 969.46
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,093.46

 KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0016-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-015-004.000 33-00009026-0000 W-81
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MOHASKA SUB LOT 10 EX BEG NE COR S 107.5' WLY 147' NWLY 27.8' NLY 206.6' SELY 198.8' TO BEG & ALL LOT 11 & LOT 12 EX E 85'
 2020 YR - 486.09 SALE PRICE: 2,500.00
 2021 YR - 413.91 SURPLUS: 1,476.00
 YR - SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON
 YR - ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 YR - DIAMOND MO 64840
 TOTAL TAX 900.00
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,024.00

 KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0017-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-015-006.000 33-00009027-0000 W-82
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MOHASKA SUB E 85' LOT 12
 2020 YR - 700.96 SALE PRICE: 8,000.00
 2021 YR - 636.94 SURPLUS: 6,538.10
 YR - SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON
 YR - ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 YR - DIAMOND MO 64840
 TOTAL TAX 1,337.90
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,461.90

 KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0018-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-015-009.000 33-00009031-0000 W-83
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MOHASKA SUB COM AT SE COR LOT 14 NW ON N LN 30TH ST 174' NE PAR WITH NW LN LOT 14 TO E LN LOT S ON E LN 284.6' TO POB
 2020 YR - 842.83 SALE PRICE: 3,000.00
 2021 YR - 765.78 SURPLUS: 1,267.39
 YR - SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON
 YR - ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
 YR - DIAMOND MO 64840
 TOTAL TAX 1,608.61
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,732.61

 KRUG, MARK C C.O.P.# W-0019-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-040-016-013.000 33-00009085-0000 W-84
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MOHASKA SUB S1/2 LOT 42
 2020 YR - 169.59 SALE PRICE: 1,538.82
 2021 YR - 145.23 SURPLUS: 1,100.00
 YR - SOLD TO: NEVELLE, LLC
 YR - ADDRESS: %GWEN ERISMAN
 TOTAL TAX 314.82 P O BOX 42
 + COST 95.00 SAGINAW MO 64864
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 438.82

 OUTLAND, DENVER D C.O.P.# W-0020-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-01-030-033-012.000 33-00009191-0000 W-85
 SECTION: 01 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.13
 MORNING SIDE LOT 11
 2020 YR - 582.26 SALE PRICE: 15,000.00
 2021 YR - 536.38 SURPLUS: 13,757.36
 YR - SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC
 YR - ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
 TOTAL TAX 1,118.64 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
 + COST 95.00 JOPLIN MO 64804
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,242.64

 BEELER, THOMAS J & ABBY J C.O.P.# W-0021-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-01-030-035-004.000 33-00009278-0000 W-88
 SECTION: 01 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.07
 MORNING SIDE S1/2 LOT 130
 2020 YR - 279.41 SALE PRICE: 661.29
 2021 YR - 257.88 SURPLUS: 0.00
 YR - SOLD TO: SKYMAR ENTERPRISES, LLC
 YR - ADDRESS: %SKYLER ROSS
 TOTAL TAX 537.29 5957 E 20TH ST
 + COST 95.00 JOPLIN MO 64801
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 661.29

 OROZCO, MARIA JUANA CITALAN C.O.P.# W-0022-2022 UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-002-011.000 33-00009597-0000 W-94
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 MURPHYS 1ST LOT 42
 2020 YR - 316.24 SALE PRICE: 1,521.33
 2021 YR - 81.09 SURPLUS: 1,000.00
 YR - SOLD TO: WILLIAM ENDICOTT
 YR - ADDRESS: 18525 CO RD 260
 TOTAL TAX 397.33 ORONOGO MO 64855
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 521.33

COULTER, DENNIS & LAURA ANN C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
MURPHYS 1ST LOT 45

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-002-014.000 33-00009600-0000 W-95

2020 YR - 428.77
2021 YR - 389.62
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 818.39
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 942.39

HUMPHREY, DOUGLASS K C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 25 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.85
NORTHERN HIGHLANDS 1ST ADD LOT 25

UPC - 16-7.0-25-040-011-076.000 33-00010693-5240 W-103

2020 YR - 446.51
2021 YR - 379.81
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 826.32
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 950.32

KUNTER INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.13
NORTON HEIGHTS LOT 5 EX E 75' & EX W 45.6' S 400'

UPC - 19-2.0-04-040-002-008.000 33-00010779-0000 W-104

2020 YR - 33.17
2021 YR - 29.67
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 62.84
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 186.84

VILLASENOR, GERARDO C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
O'KEEPES 2ND LOT 103

UPC - 19-5.0-15-010-037-003.000 33-00011216-0000 W-116

2020 YR - 96.64
2021 YR - 83.40
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 180.04
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 304.04

JOPLIN SOUTHERN CORP C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 18 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.50
JOP SOUTHERN CORP 1ST N 25' LOT 6 BLK 4 & BEG NW COR LOT 6 BLK 4 W 430.68' S 25' E 430.68' N TO POB

UPC - 20-4.0-18-000-000-051.001 35-00014320-1000 W-142

2020 YR - 190.85
2021 YR - 163.84
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 354.69
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 478.69

ALLEN, PAUL D SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.16 C.O.P.# W-0023-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-02-030-004-001.000 35-00014806-0000 W-146

2020 YR - 61.80
2021 YR - 53.91
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 439.71
SURPLUS: 200.00
SOLD TO: JOPLIN AREA HABITAT FOR HUMANITY

TOTAL TAX 115.71
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 239.71

ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
5201 N MAIN ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

ONSTOT, JAMES B & STEPHANIE SECTION: 16 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.08 C.O.P.# W-0024-2022

UPC - 19-5.0-16-040-001-051.003 35-00016134-0000 W-158

WOODLAND HILLS SOUTH COM SE COR LOT 23 S 90 DEG W 136' TO SW COR LOT 23 N 81.48' TO POB CONT N 18.57' TO NW COR LOT 23 CONT N 50.07' N 85 DEG E 41.64' N 83 DEG E 95.23' TO W R/W AVE S 67 DEG W 75.76' S 85 DEG W 36.53' CRV RGT RAD/6.44' CHR/D/BEAR S 4
2020 YR - 30.42
2021 YR - 27.37
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 281.79
SURPLUS: 100.00
SOLD TO: RUSSELL REED

TOTAL TAX 57.79
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 181.79

ADDRESS: 1811 VIRGINIA
JOPLIN MO 64801

JOHNSON, KRAIG SECTION: 01 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.15 C.O.P.# W-0025-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-01-030-022-009.000 35-00016363-0000 W-161

2020 YR - 453.34
YR -
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 40,000.00
SURPLUS: 39,422.66
SOLD TO: JOHN DENZEL, LLC

TOTAL TAX 453.34
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 577.34

ADDRESS: %JAMES STILL
426 W FIR RD #169
CARTHAGE MO 64836

JOPLIN SOUTHERN CORP SECTION: 18 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 32 ACRES: 0.67 C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 20-4.0-18-000-000-079.000 35-00016576-1000 W-162

JOP MISC BEG NE COR BLK 5 JOP SOUTHERN CORP 1ST E 759.16' S 0.28' SLY 438.90' ALG CURV RT W/RAD 394.41' S 64 DEG W 42.49' S 65' N 6 4 DEG E 73.21' NE ALG CURV LT W/454.41' RAD 506.52' W TO POB
2020 YR - 813.35
2021 YR - 693.19
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 1,506.54
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 1,630.54

ADDRESS:

TANNER, DEVIN SECTION: 12 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.13 C.O.P.# W-0026-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-12-020-010-056.021 35-00017323-5621 W-168

JOP MISC COM NW COR NE NW S 973.53' TO N LN M-3 P-13 S 71 DEG E 539.22' TO POB S 71 DEG E 178.18' S 5 DEG W 48.21' TO N LN RR N 84 DEG W 177.69' N 5 DEG E 88.26' TO POB
2020 YR - 1,251.40
2021 YR - 1,156.95
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 15,000.00
SURPLUS: 12,467.65
SOLD TO: VINCENT PATTON

TOTAL TAX 2,408.35
+ COST 95.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,532.35

ADDRESS: 100 CO RD 130
DIAMOND MO 64840

TUNNELL, BROCK M ETAL C.O.P.# W-0027-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-12-040-012-002.000 35-00017326-0000 W-169
 SECTION: 12 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 JOP MISC BEG SW COR PARCEL 42 M-12 N 170' E 105' S 170' W TO BEG PART PAR 42 M-12 EX S 10' FOR ST

2020 YR - 242.58
 2021 YR - 207.06
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 573.64
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: COUNTY 2022, LLC

TOTAL TAX 449.64
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 573.64

ADDRESS: %TIM BENDER
 2401 E 32ND ST #10-339
 JOPLIN MO 64804

KUNTER INVESTMENTS C.O.P.# W-0028-2022 UPC - 16-1.0-02-000-000-008.000 35-00017666-0100 W-171
 SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 28 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 JOP MISC N1/2 SE SE LYING S OF CRK

2020 YR - 17.79
 2021 YR - 16.64
 YR -
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 158.43
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: CURTIS HALL

TOTAL TAX 34.43
 + COST 95.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 158.43

ADDRESS: 864 STATE HWY 96
 SARCOXIE MO 64862

DAY, KIMBERLY K C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.15
JOP ORIG LOT 4 BLK 3

UPC - 19-1.0-02-020-008-002.000 31-00000022-0000 W-172

2019 YR - 244.88
2020 YR - 216.64
2021 YR - 196.08
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: PAID BEFORE SALE

TOTAL TAX 657.60
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 806.60

ADDRESS:

BANKS, MICHAEL P & VICKI G C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
BYERS & MURPHYS 2ND LOT 12

UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-012-016.000 31-00001011-0000 W-173

2019 YR - 46.39
2020 YR - 42.04
2021 YR - 37.18
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 125.61
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 274.61

ADDRESS:

SCOTT, RICHARD A C.O.P.# W-0029-2022
SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.29
BYERS & MURPHYS 2ND LOTS 63 & 64

UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-003-008.000 31-00001055-0000 W-174

2019 YR - 80.51
2020 YR - 72.03
2021 YR - 62.60
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,064.14
SURPLUS: 700.00
SOLD TO: BYRON TURNER

TOTAL TAX 215.14
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 364.14

ADDRESS: 2929 S WALL ST
JOPLIN MO 64804

THOMPSON, PAULINE C.O.P.# W-0030-2022
SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
CAMPBELL'S 4TH LOT 99

UPC - 19-1.0-11-010-006-008.000 31-00001803-0000 W-175

2019 YR - 64.22
2020 YR - 57.72
2021 YR - 50.46
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 321.40
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: RUSSELL REED

TOTAL TAX 172.40
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 321.40

ADDRESS: 1811 VIRGINIA
JOPLIN MO 64801

DOBEMAR INVESTMENTS INC C.O.P.# W-0031-2022
SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
CAMPBELL'S 5TH LOT 6

UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-036-008.000 31-00001830-0000 W-176

2019 YR - 406.94
2020 YR - 359.22
2021 YR - 70.11
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 985.27
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: TODD MCCORCLE

TOTAL TAX 836.27
+ COST 120.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 985.27

ADDRESS: 2725 E 12TH
JOPLIN MO 64801

MCGRIFF, FRANK W JR C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
 SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
 CONTINENTAL ADD LOT 69

UPC - 19-2.0-04-040-010-004.000 31-00003723-0000 W-178

2019 YR - 68.09
 2020 YR - 61.14
 2021 YR - 53.37
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 182.60
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 331.60

ADDRESS:

ROWAN, REBECCA L C.O.P.# W-0032-2022
 SECTION: 15 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 T W CUNNINGHAM'S LOT 61

UPC - 19-5.0-15-020-039-016.000 31-00004321-0000 W-179

2019 YR - 103.80
 2020 YR - 92.53
 2021 YR - 79.93
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 425.26
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: F & CB CONSTRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 276.26
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 425.26

ADDRESS: %FERMIN BENHUMEA
 1303 FURNACE ST
 JOPLIN MO 64801

HUDSON, PAULINE & CHRISTOPHER C L F C.O.P.# W-0033-2022
 SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.07
 PARK VIEW ADD N1/2 LOT 41

UPC - 19-2.0-04-030-017-009.000 33-00011286-0000 W-181

2019 YR - 213.88
 2020 YR - 189.37
 2021 YR - 172.96
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 725.21
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: JAKE MCCAIN

TOTAL TAX 576.21
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 725.21

ADDRESS: 2920 W 15TH ST
 JOPLIN MO 64801

WEINKEIN, DARYL & BARBARA C.O.P.# W-0034-2022
 SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
 PARK VIEW ADD LOT 156

UPC - 19-2.0-04-021-013-003.000 33-00011360-0000 W-182

2019 YR - 71.21
 2020 YR - 63.86
 2021 YR - 55.66
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 339.73
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: F & CB CONSTRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 190.73
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 339.73

ADDRESS: %FERMIN BENHUMEA
 1303 FURNACE ST
 JOPLIN MO 64801

MARTIN, MICHELE R & DORA BEALMEAR C.O.P.# W-0035-2022
 SECTION: 04 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
 PARK VIEW ADD LOT 248

UPC - 19-2.0-04-021-011-006.000 33-00011426-0000 W-183

2019 YR - 269.71
 2020 YR - 63.86
 2021 YR - 55.66
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 2,538.23
 SURPLUS: 2,000.00
 SOLD TO: GUILLERMO ALEXANDER LUARCA SITAVI

TOTAL TAX 389.23
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 538.23

ADDRESS: 219 N OAK AVE
 JOPLIN MO 64801

HAYES, AARON C.O.P.# W-0036-2022
 SECTION: 09 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 SERGEANT & CO'S LOT 47

UPC - 19-2.0-09-020-022-011.000 35-00013392-0000 W-184

2019 YR - 78.95
 2020 YR - 70.70
 2021 YR - 61.42
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,560.07
 SURPLUS: 1,200.00
 SOLD TO: JOPLIN AREA HABITAT FOR HUMANITY

TOTAL TAX 211.07
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 360.07

ADDRESS: %SCOTT CLAYTON
 5201 N MAIN ST
 JOPLIN MO 64801

ESTATE HOLDINGS C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
 SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.25
 SPRING PARK LOTS 114 & 115

UPC - 19-1.0-02-040-029-002.000 35-00014621-0000 W-185

2019 YR - 720.97
 2020 YR - 136.14
 2021 YR - 116.90
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
 SURPLUS: 0.00
 SOLD TO: NO BID

TOTAL TAX 974.01
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 1,123.01

ADDRESS:

TUCKER, ALBERT M JR C.O.P.# W-0037-2022
 SECTION: 03 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
 WILSON & HUTTON 1ST LOT 87

UPC - 19-2.0-03-010-030-012.000 35-00015545-0000 W-186

2019 YR - 390.66
 2020 YR - 62.49
 2021 YR - 54.51
 YR -
 YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,656.66
 SURPLUS: 1,000.00
 SOLD TO: RENOVATION COLLECTIVE, LLC

TOTAL TAX 507.66
 + COST 120.00
 + REC. FEE 29.00
 TOTAL 656.66

ADDRESS: %LEWANN SOWERSBY
 404 N BYERS AVE
 JOPLIN MO 64801

GODBER, SUSAN L SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
BYERS, MURPHYS & CONNORS LOT 24

C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 19-2.0-10-020-012-011.000

31-00001296-0000

W-187

2018 YR - 53.12
2019 YR - 48.71
2020 YR - 44.08
2021 YR - 38.89
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 184.80
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 358.80

HUGHES, JACOB SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
CAMPBELL'S 9TH N 50' S 100' LOT 67

C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-11-030-033-006.000

31-00002356-0000

W-188

2018 YR - 95.44
2019 YR - 86.72
2020 YR - 77.50
2021 YR - 67.22
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 326.88
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 500.88

BALDWIN RENTAL INVESTMENTS SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
J C COX JR 3RD LOT 60

C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-016-002.000

31-00004064-0000

W-189

2018 YR - 90.62
2019 YR - 82.35
2020 YR - 73.66
2021 YR - 64.19
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 310.82
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 484.82

PLILIER, CHARLOTTE ESTATE SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.14
J C COX JR 4TH LOT 61

C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-034-009.000

31-00004166-0000

W-190

2018 YR - 52.27
2019 YR - 64.22
2020 YR - 57.72
2021 YR - 50.46
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 224.67
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 398.67

MITCHELL, J GLENN & MARGARET S SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.03
EAST JOPLIN LOTS 15 & 16 BLK 9 E OF RR SPUR THAT RUNS SWLY DIR & N 1/2 VAC ALLEY ADJ

C.O.P.# W-0000-2022

UPC - 19-1.0-02-010-020-001.000

31-00005053-0000

W-191

2018 YR - 22.89
2019 YR - 25.46
2020 YR - 23.61
2021 YR - 21.57
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

ADDRESS:

TOTAL TAX 93.53
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 267.53

CLARK, ALICE N C.O.P.# W-0038-2022
SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.21
EAST JOPLIN LOTS 13 TO 16 INC BLK 14

UPC - 19-1.0-02-010-017-001.000 31-00005085-0000 W-192

2018 YR - 82.48
2019 YR - 103.78
2020 YR - 92.53
2021 YR - 79.93
YR -

SALE PRICE: 1,532.72
SURPLUS: 1,000.00
SOLD TO: F & CB CONSTRUCTION, LLC

TOTAL TAX 358.72
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 532.72

ADDRESS: %FERMIN BENHUMEA
1303 FURNACE ST
JOPLIN MO 64801

HASSELBERG, MARK C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 13 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
MC ALLISTER 2ND REPLAT BEG SE COR LOT 6 DOUGLAS SUB LN RR NWLY ALG RR 69.61' N 128' E TO POB

UPC - 19-6.0-13-040-002-007.008 33-00008225-1100 W-193

2018 YR - 37.57
2021 YR - 33.14
YR -
YR -
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

TOTAL TAX 70.71
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 244.71

ADDRESS:

ZACHARY TRUST AGREEMENT C.O.P.# W-0039-2022
SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.13
SO JOP L CO 1ST LOT 72

UPC - 19-2.0-10-040-030-001.000 35-00013757-0000 W-194

2018 YR - 85.95
2019 YR - 99.91
2020 YR - 89.09
2021 YR - 77.03
YR -

SALE PRICE: 3,025.98
SURPLUS: 2,500.00
SOLD TO: WILLIAM ENDICOTT

TOTAL TAX 351.98
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 525.98

ADDRESS: 18525 CO RD 260
ORONO MO 64855

KROKROSKIA, GLADYS FERN C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
SO JOP L CO 4TH LOT 5

UPC - 19-2.0-10-030-008-005.000 35-00014212-0000 W-195

2018 YR - 645.67
2019 YR - 603.14
2020 YR - 531.81
2021 YR - 374.60
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

TOTAL TAX 2,155.22
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,329.22

ADDRESS:

HIXSON, DUANE S & KATHY D C.O.P.# W-0000-2022
SECTION: 02 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.03
JOP MISC LOT 6

UPC - 19-1.0-02-030-039-003.000 35-00016693-0000 W-196

2018 YR - 142.22
2019 YR - 181.45
2020 YR - 160.95
2021 YR - 138.40
YR -

SALE PRICE: 0.00
SURPLUS: 0.00
SOLD TO: JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE

TOTAL TAX 623.02
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 797.02

ADDRESS:

JOPLIN FLYING ASSOCIATES INC C.O.P.# W-0040-2022 UPC - 19-2.0-10-010-035-010.001 35-00017124-1100 W-197
SECTION: 10 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 1.73
JOP MISC BEG 20' N SW COR LOT 16 CARTER'S 1ST E 404' S 212.5' NWLY 250' S TO SE COR LOT 18 W TO SW COR LOT 18 N TO POB

2018 YR -	568.62	SALE PRICE:	2,040.12
2019 YR -	492.19	SURPLUS:	0.00
2020 YR -	434.39	SOLD TO:	TRAVIS GOODHUE
2021 YR -	370.92		
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 1,866.12
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 2,040.12

ADDRESS: 206 E 15TH ST
JOPLIN MO 64804

SHADE, MICHAEL & PATRICIA C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-020-023.000 35-00017283-0000 W-198
SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
JOP MISC PARCELS 401 & 406 M-46 BEG NE COR M-215 E TO RR S ALONG RR TO MO PAC RR W TO PT S OF BEG N TO BEG

2018 YR -	250.65	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2019 YR -	225.86	SURPLUS:	0.00
2020 YR -	199.97	SOLD TO:	JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE
2021 YR -	171.59		
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 848.07
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 1,022.07

ADDRESS:

SHADE, MICHAEL & PATRICIA C.O.P.# W-0000-2022 UPC - 19-1.0-11-020-020-020.000 35-00017303-0000 W-199
SECTION: 11 TOWNSHIP: 27 RANGE: 33 ACRES: 0.00
JOP MISC LOT 215 & BEG SW COR LOT 215 W 60' S 125' NELY 185' N TO SE COR LOT 215 W TO BEG PART P-406 M-46

2018 YR -	192.17	SALE PRICE:	0.00
2019 YR -	247.22	SURPLUS:	0.00
2020 YR -	218.69	SOLD TO:	JASPER COUNTY TRUSTEE
2021 YR -	186.79		
YR -			

TOTAL TAX 844.87
+ COST 145.00
+ REC. FEE 29.00
TOTAL 1,018.87

ADDRESS: